

EXHIBIT 6

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/22/2019	0.70	626.50	Discussions with MAVNIs concerning issues/updates/concerns.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/23/2019	2.00	2,390.00	Address status/strategy; call w. plaintiff.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/23/2019	4.20	3,759.00	Discuss issues/concerns/updates, including call with plaintiff, emails with team members, and emails with other MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/24/2019	1.50	1,792.50	Draft guidance to MAVNI; address status/strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/24/2019	4.40	3,938.00	Address MAVNI naturalization processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with team members, common interest counsel, and MAVNIs (including plaintiff).
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/25/2019	1.50	1,792.50	Address counsel correspondence, status, and strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/25/2019	5.20	4,654.00	Address MAVNI naturalization processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/26/2019	3.90	3,490.50	Address MAVNI naturalization processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/27/2019	1.20	1,074.00	Emails from MAVNIs and common interest counsel re naturalization application processing updates/questions/concerns.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/28/2019	1.50	1,792.50	Address status and case management.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/28/2019	4.90	4,385.50	Address MAVNI questions/update/concerns re naturalization application processing, including discussions with MAVNIs and others.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/29/2019	2.50	2,237.50	Address MAVNI naturalization processing issues and questions, including discussions with MAVNIs and others.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/30/2019	0.70	836.50	Meet and confer w. DOJ counsel and follow-up.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/30/2019	4.30	3,848.50	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including discussions re denial following non-discharge and discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel; discussions re DOJ's decertification argument; meet and confer with DOJ counsel and follow-up re same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/31/2019	3.50	3,132.50	Address naturalization application processing issues and questions, including discussions with MAVNIs re same.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/1/2019	0.50	597.50	Address MAVNI correspondence and calls.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/1/2019	3.50	3,132.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/2/2019	4.20	3,759.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/questions/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs; conference with ML attorneys re matter.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/2/2019	1.20	1,434.00	Address status, strategy, other issues; conference with ML attorneys re matter.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/4/2019	0.30	268.50	Emails re MAVNI naturalization application processing concerns/questions.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/5/2019	5.90	5,280.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/questions/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and others.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/5/2019	1.50	1,792.50	Address class inquiries, strategy and status.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/6/2019	1.20	1,434.00	Address DOJ correspondence and status.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/6/2019	5.20	4,654.00	Address questions/updates/concerns regarding MAVNI naturalization application processing, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/7/2019	1.90	2,270.50	Address DOJ filings and respond to client inquiries.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/7/2019	5.50	4,922.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and review of recent Government class-wide reporting.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/8/2019	4.80	4,296.00	Address MAVNI soldiers' naturalization application processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/9/2019	5.90	5,280.50	Address MAVNI naturalization processing issues/updates/concerns/questions, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/10/2019	0.20	179.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issue.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/12/2019	1.20	1,434.00	Address DOJ correspondence and status; MAVNI communications.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/12/2019	6.50	5,817.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/questions/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/13/2019	3.00	3,585.00	Response to Government status report; confer w. J. Wollenberg; call w. common interest counsel re MAVNI; review status.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/13/2019	7.50	6,712.50	Address MAVNI naturalization processing issues and questions, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel; draft and file brief.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/14/2019	4.50	5,377.50	Prepare for and attend court hearing; confer w. clients; follow-up.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/14/2019	8.50	7,607.50	Prepare for and attend Nio hearing; address MAVNI naturalization processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/15/2019	2.20	2,629.00	Address hearing follow-up, DOJ correspondence, research, and strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/15/2019	3.00	2,685.00	Address MAVNI naturalization processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and team members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/16/2019	6.00	5,370.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, common interest counsel, and DOJ/USCIS.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/16/2019	1.50	1,792.50	Address status and DOJ correspondence.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/17/2019	2.50	2,237.50	Call from MAVNI concerning processing of naturalization application; emails with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel re updates/concerns/questions about naturalization application processing.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/19/2019	2.50	2,987.50	Address DOJ correspondence and status.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/19/2019	6.70	5,996.50	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns re naturalization application processing, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, team members, and DOJ/USCIS.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/20/2019	7.20	6,444.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing questions, issues, and concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, common interest counsel, and DOJ/USCIS.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/21/2019	2.50	2,987.50	Address DOJ correspondence, MAVNI communications, and strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/21/2019	7.80	6,981.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with a number of MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/22/2019	1.50	1,792.50	Address correspondence w. DOJ and developments.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/22/2019	5.70	5,101.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/23/2019	2.10	2,509.50	Correspondence w. DOJ; correspondence w. co-counsel and soldiers; confer w. J. Wollenberg re status and strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/23/2019	6.50	5,817.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/25/2019	6.20	5,549.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including emails and calls with MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/26/2019	1.50	1,792.50	Address DOJ correspondence and strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/26/2019	6.90	6,175.50	Address issues and questions with naturalization application processing, including discussions with MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/27/2019	3.50	4,182.50	Multiple calls and emails with co-counsel and DOJ

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/27/2019	10.10	9,039.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, emails to DOJ, discussions with common interest counsel, and discussions with team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/28/2019	2.50	2,987.50	Address correspondence w. DOJ attorneys, client communications, and address status and strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/28/2019	7.80	6,981.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including communications with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and DOJ/USCIS.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/29/2019	2.50	2,987.50	Address DOJ/USCIS responses and draft correspondence; address co-counsel and client inquiries; confer w. J. Wollenberg re status and strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/29/2019	6.90	6,175.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues and updates, including communications with MAVNIs and DOJ/USCIS.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/30/2019	2.50	2,987.50	Address DOJ correspondence, individual class member inquiries, and status/strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/30/2019	6.20	5,549.00	Address naturalization application processing issues.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/1/2019	0.50	447.50	Emails from MAVNIs and team members concerning naturalization application processing.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/2/2019	0.50	597.50	Address DOJ and client correspondence.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/2/2019	10.50	9,397.50	Emails and calls with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel concerning naturalization application issues/updates/concerns.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	9/3/2019	0.20	142.00	Discuss matter with J. Wollenberg and N. Raol.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/3/2019	2.50	2,987.50	Address correspondence w. DOJ; client and co-counsel calls; strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/3/2019	7.90	7,070.50	Address MAVNI naturalization processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	9/4/2019	1.50	1,065.00	Discuss case with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, and N. Raol; analyze status report.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/4/2019	1.60	1,912.00	Address developments, DOJ report, correspondence, and strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/4/2019	5.90	5,280.50	Address MAVNI updates/issues/concerns re naturalization application processing, including discussions with MAVNIs and others.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	9/5/2019	3.00	2,130.00	Discuss cases with J. Wollenberg; prepare client communications.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/5/2019	2.30	2,748.50	Address DOJ correspondence; status and strategy; client and co-counsel communications.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/5/2019	7.80	6,981.00	Address MAVNI issues/updates/questions re naturalization application processing.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/6/2019	1.20	1,434.00	Address client developments and confer w. team re strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/6/2019	6.50	5,817.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and others re same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/7/2019	1.40	1,253.00	Address MAVNI naturalization issue, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/9/2019	1.80	2,151.00	Address status and strategy; correspondence w. DOJ.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	9/9/2019	0.20	142.00	Review status report.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/9/2019	4.70	3,337.00	Review and follow-up on class member correspondence; confer with J. Wollenberg, others re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/9/2019	7.20	6,444.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including emails with MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/10/2019	2.20	2,629.00	Address DOJ correspondence and class member inquiries; confer w. J. Wollenberg re status.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	9/10/2019	0.30	213.00	Discuss case with J. Wollenberg.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/10/2019	4.80	3,408.00	Confer with J. Wollenberg; prepare material for individual class member counsel; confer with class members, counsel; review and prepare correspondence re class member inquiries / updates.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/10/2019	6.40	5,728.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/11/2019	1.40	1,673.00	Address DOJ correspondence and strategy; client meeting.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/11/2019	3.00	2,130.00	Correspondence with class members re: status, next steps; confer with class member.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/11/2019	3.20	2,864.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/12/2019	0.80	956.00	Confer w. class member immigration counsel; address status and strategy.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	9/12/2019	0.20	142.00	Discuss case with N. Raol; review orders.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/12/2019	5.00	3,550.00	Review / follow-up re: USCIS correspondence on particular class members; follow-up re: same; confer with various class members; confer with J. Wollenberg and team re: same; review MAVNI website for updates.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/12/2019	4.90	4,385.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/questions/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/13/2019	0.70	836.50	Address class member inquiries and status
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/13/2019	5.40	4,833.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/14/2019	0.50	447.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/15/2019	1.20	1,074.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including emails from team members and MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/16/2019	0.50	597.50	Address correspondence w. DOJ and status.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/16/2019	3.30	2,343.00	Correspondence with various class members and individual counsel; review status re: same; internal correspondence / follow-up re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/16/2019	6.80	6,086.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing questions and issues, including conversations with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/17/2019	3.10	2,201.00	Prep for and confer with team members re: case background, tasks, responsibilities; confer with various class members re: status, upcoming reports, and next steps; follow-up internal conferences with J. Wollenberg, D. Baruch.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/17/2019	1.40	1,673.00	Address DOJ correspondence and strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/17/2019	2.70	2,416.50	Address MAVNI soldier naturalization application processing issues, including emails with MAVNI soldiers, team members, and common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/18/2019	2.50	1,775.00	Review reports filed by government; confer and correspond with various class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/18/2019	5.60	5,012.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members and review of Government's latest reporting.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/19/2019	1.50	1,792.50	Review and strategize re DOJ report; confer w. J. Wollenberg.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	9/19/2019	0.20	142.00	Review status report.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/19/2019	3.10	2,201.00	Analyze government report; identify particular issues and statistics re: non-compliance; correspondence with various class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/19/2019	5.30	4,743.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/20/2019	2.50	2,987.50	Address DOJ filing, status, and strategy; confer w. J. Wollenberg re same.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	9/20/2019	3.70	2,627.00	Analyze Status Report; prepare Reply to Status Report; discuss case with J. Wollenberg; discuss case with N. Raol.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/20/2019	3.20	2,272.00	Conferences with J. Wollenberg, K. Kaplan re: analysis of DOJ report and upcoming Nio filing/hearing; confer / correspondence with various class members.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/20/2019	4.90	4,385.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing questions/updates/concerns, including draft response to Government's September 18 Report.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/21/2019	1.70	1,521.50	Draft response to Defendants' September 18 Report.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/22/2019	1.50	1,792.50	Address notice in response to Defendants' status report.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/22/2019	5.40	4,833.00	Draft response to Defendants' September 18 Report.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/23/2019	5.60	6,692.00	Finalize notice re Defendants' status report; prepare for hearing; attend court hearing; follow-up and strategy.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	9/23/2019	4.00	2,840.00	Prepare for and attend status hearing; discuss case with D. Baruch and J. Wollenberg.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/23/2019	2.10	1,491.00	Email correspondence re: client site; confer with J. Wollenberg and D. Baruch re: court hearing, status, next steps; correspondence with class members, individual counsel re: government reporting.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/23/2019	13.50	12,082.50	Draft and file response to Defendants' September 18 Report; prepare for and attend status hearing; address MAVNI questions/updates/concerns regarding N-400 processing.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	9/24/2019	0.40	284.00	Analyze related case decision.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/24/2019	2.00	1,420.00	Review and follow-up on correspondence with class members; confer with J. Wollenberg re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/24/2019	6.10	5,459.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/updates/concerns, including communication with MAVNIs and follow-up re same.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/25/2019	2.30	2,748.50	Address status and strategy.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/25/2019	2.20	1,562.00	Correspondence with class members, individual counsel re: status, next steps, government reporting; confer with J. Wollenberg re: individual class members and government follow-up; follow-up re: transcript request.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/25/2019	5.90	5,280.50	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns regarding naturalization application processing and related issues.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/26/2019	1.60	1,912.00	Address status, strategy, client communications, and DOJ correspondence.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/26/2019	1.80	1,278.00	Review class member correspondence and follow-up; confer with J. Wollenberg re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/26/2019	6.30	5,638.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and others regarding the same.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/27/2019	1.20	1,434.00	Address status and DOJ correspondence; Review DOJ filing.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/27/2019	2.50	1,775.00	Review and respond to various class member updates and requests re: interview / USCIS issues; confer with J. Wollenberg re: same and government follow-up / draft emails to USCIS/DOJ.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/27/2019	7.20	6,444.00	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns regarding N-400 applications, including discussions with MAVNIs and N. Raol.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/28/2019	0.50	447.50	Address MAVNI N-400 issues/updates, including emails with MAVNI.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	9/30/2019	0.80	956.00	Address DOJ correspondence and updates.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/30/2019	1.00	710.00	Class member correspondence; follow-up with team re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/30/2019	6.50	5,817.50	Address MAVNI N-426 issues/updates/concerns, including communications with MAVNIs and DOJ/USCIS.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/1/2019	7.50	6,712.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, discussions with common interest counsel, and emails to/from USCIS/DOJ; send D. Baruch background materials for potential filing.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/1/2019	2.50	2,987.50	Drafting and revising potential filing and reviewing soldier background information re same.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/1/2019	2.10	1,491.00	Confer/correspond with various class members and individual counsel; confer with J. Wollenberg regarding next steps and government emails; review draft update for website and email language.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/2/2019	6.50	5,817.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/questions/concerns, including communications with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/2/2019	1.00	710.00	Confer/correspondence with class members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/2/2019	5.00	5,975.00	Drafting and revising pleading re natz issues and reviewing soldier background information re same.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/3/2019	6.00	7,170.00	Address DOJ correspondence and client inquiries; address naturalization issues and potential filing re same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/3/2019	1.50	1,065.00	Correspond/confer with class members regarding status, next steps, upcoming / not scheduled interviews.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/3/2019	6.20	5,549.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and others.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/4/2019	7.50	8,962.50	Address DOJ correspondence; address class member issues re naturalization and potential filing re same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/4/2019	1.30	923.00	Review DOJ/USCIS responses to various class member inquiries; follow-up correspondence and conference regarding government updates, status, and next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/4/2019	5.50	4,922.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/6/2019	0.50	447.50	Review emails concerning MAVNI naturalization application processing issues and discussions with common interest counsel re same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/7/2019	5.20	4,654.00	Address MAVNI naturalization related issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and government officials.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/7/2019	3.50	4,182.50	Drafting re class member naturalization issues.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/8/2019	6.50	5,817.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and government officials; review and comment on draft re USCIS naturalization issues.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/8/2019	3.50	4,182.50	Drafting and revising document re USCIS naturalization policy/practice impacting class members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/9/2019	1.20	1,434.00	Drafting re class member naturalization issues.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/9/2019	4.40	3,938.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/questions/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/10/2019	3.80	4,541.00	Drafting re USCIS naturalization policy/practice issues impacting class members; addressing status and strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/10/2019	4.50	4,027.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/questions/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/11/2019	3.10	3,704.50	Address description of class members' issues with USCIS policy/practice; confer w. J. Wollenberg re status; meeting w. B. Mendelson re assignments.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/11/2019	4.00	3,580.00	Address MAVNI naturalization related issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	10/13/2019	2.80	1,400.00	Review Nio MSJ materials and court's Memorandum Opinion and Order.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/14/2019	5.50	4,922.50	Address MAVNI N-400 issues, including discussions with class members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/14/2019	2.30	2,748.50	Address status and strategy; continued research and drafting re class member naturalization issues.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/15/2019	4.90	4,385.50	Address N-400 processing issues, including calls with MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/15/2019	1.50	1,792.50	Calls w. MAVNIs re naturalization policies/practices of USCIS. Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/updates/concerns, including
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/16/2019	7.40	6,623.00	discussions with MAVNIs and others.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/16/2019	0.80	956.00	Calls w. MAVNIs re USCIS naturalization policies/practices.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/17/2019	4.30	3,848.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/updates/concerns.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/18/2019	1.80	2,151.00	Address class member updates/concerns; address class inquiries.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/18/2019	4.80	4,296.00	Address MAVNI N-400 issues.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/19/2019	3.30	2,953.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/20/2019	2.40	2,868.00	Edits and revisions to descriptions of MAVNI N-400 problems. Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/updates/concerns, including emails
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/20/2019	2.30	2,058.50	with MAVNIs and others.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/21/2019	1.20	1,434.00	Drafting re N-400 processing problems. Review Nio inbox activity and identify various follow-up action items/class member correspondence
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/21/2019	1.50	1,065.00	and status. Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/updates/concerns, including
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/21/2019	4.50	4,027.50	discussions with MAVNIs and others.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	10/22/2019	1.20	600.00	Discussed with N. Raol the Nio and Kirwa class counsel inboxes and responding to emails.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/22/2019	3.80	4,541.00	Drafting re N-400 processing problems.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	10/22/2019	1.30	923.00	Prepare summaries for common interest counsel. Review various emails from class members and respond; confer with B. Mendelson re: case
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/22/2019	2.00	1,420.00	background, Nio inbox and class member inquiries/responses. Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, including emails with MAVNI and
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/22/2019	3.60	3,222.00	common interest counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/23/2019	1.50	1,792.50	Edits and revisions to descriptions of MAVNI N-400 problems. Review class member inquiries and draft responses; review information and follow-up re: class
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/23/2019	3.50	2,485.00	members.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	10/23/2019	2.10	1,050.00	Reviewed Nio class counsel inbox; replied to Nio class counsel inbox emails with N. Raol. Address MAVNI naturalization application issues/updates/concerns, including emails with MAVNIs
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/24/2019	3.90	3,490.50	and draft materials re MAVNI naturalization problems.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/24/2019	2.40	2,868.00	Drafting re N-400 processing problems.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	10/24/2019	1.30	923.00	Prepare summaries of MAVNI N-400 issues/problems. Searched Nio and Kirwa class counsel inboxes for names of certain MAVNI soldiers per request of
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	10/24/2019	1.40	700.00	J. Wollenberg.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/25/2019	1.00	895.00	Address class members issues/problems. Correspondence with class members; confer with class member re: next steps, class member
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/25/2019	1.90	1,349.00	status.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	10/25/2019	3.80	2,698.00	Drafting re MAVNI N-400 issues.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	10/25/2019	2.50	1,250.00	Review Nio class counsel inbox and respond to MAVNI soldiers' emails.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/26/2019	1.40	1,673.00	Drafting re MAVNI N-400 concerns/issues.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/28/2019	2.60	3,107.00	Research and revisions re descriptions of MAVNI N-400 issues/problems.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	10/28/2019	0.80	568.00	Update class action website.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	10/28/2019	0.20	100.00	Review emails to Nio class counsel inbox.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/28/2019	5.50	4,922.50	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues, concerns, and updates, including call with B. McNamara and discussions with MAVNIs; discussions re Congressional hearing.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/29/2019	2.50	2,987.50	Addressing summary of MAVNI N-400 issues.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	10/29/2019	3.10	2,201.00	Prepare draft of N-400 issues; view House Judiciary hearing on impact of immigration on veterans.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	10/29/2019	3.10	1,550.00	Review and respond to Nio class counsel emails; update MAVNI website. Review and revise draft emails for class members; confer/correspond with B. Mendelson re: same; review House Judiciary subcommittee hearing on immigration and military soldiers statements and testimony.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/29/2019	4.30	3,053.00	Address naturalization application processing issues.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/29/2019	4.30	3,848.50	Further review and updates to summary of N-400 issues.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/30/2019	1.20	1,434.00	Review and respond to Nio class counsel emails; update MAVNI website.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	10/30/2019	1.80	900.00	Address DOJ 6-week report.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/30/2019	0.80	956.00	Review DOJ report; confer and correspond with class members, individual counsel for class members re: same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/30/2019	1.40	994.00	Address naturalization processing issues and concerns.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/30/2019	3.90	3,490.50	Prepare email correspondence regarding MAVNI soldiers.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	10/31/2019	0.30	213.00	Researching, drafting, revising summary of N-400 issues.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	10/31/2019	3.20	3,824.00	Review Nio class counsel inbox; draft correspondence with MAVNI soldiers.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	10/31/2019	1.20	600.00	Address N-400 issues and updates, including new reporting.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/31/2019	3.60	3,222.00	Address summary of N-400 issues; confer w. J. Wollenberg.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	11/1/2019	2.50	2,987.50	Discuss case and related cases with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, N. Raol, and B. Mendelson; prepare litigation documents.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	11/1/2019	3.00	2,130.00	Participate in meeting with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, K. Kaplan, and N. Raol regarding case and related cases; discuss MAVNI materials with J. Wollenberg.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/1/2019	1.40	700.00	Prepare MAVNI materials for circulation to clients; address MAVNI N-400 processing issues.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/1/2019	8.90	7,965.50	Prepare materials to address MAVNI N-400 issues; discuss MAVNI issues with J. Wollenberg.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	11/4/2019	1.30	923.00	Review/revise summaries of MAVNI N-400 issues.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/4/2019	10.20	5,100.00	Draft various individual class member inquiry emails to USCIS and DOJ; correspondence with individual attorneys of class members; confer/correspond with various class members; internal correspondence regarding class inbox.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/4/2019	2.90	2,059.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including emails and calls with MAVNIs and emails to USCIS/DOJ.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/4/2019	3.80	3,401.00	Prepare MAVNI summaries; discuss MAVNI issues with J. Wollenberg.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	11/5/2019	3.00	2,130.00	Review inbox inquiries; respond to class members; confer with J. Wollenberg re: follow-up correspondence to USCIS re: individual class members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/5/2019	3.00	2,130.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing problems and questions, including discussions with MAVNIs and others.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/5/2019	4.20	3,759.00	Prepare MAVNI summaries/materials re N-400 issues.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	11/6/2019	7.40	5,254.00	Update MAVNI website.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/6/2019	0.30	150.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs re same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/6/2019	3.20	2,864.00	Update MAVNI website.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/7/2019	0.30	150.00	

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/7/2019	3.60	3,222.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/updates/concerns, including calls and emails with MAVNIs.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/8/2019	0.80	400.00	Update MAVNI website; review Nio class counsel inbox.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/8/2019	4.20	3,759.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	11/11/2019	0.80	956.00	Review status; address correspondence w. USCIS and DOJ.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/11/2019	0.20	100.00	Review updates to MAVNI website.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/11/2019	6.40	4,544.00	Prepare and send emails to USCIS and DOJ regarding various class members; review Defendants' reports; class member correspondence regarding delays, next steps; confer with team re: same. Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including emails with MAVNIs, team members, and to USCIS/DOJ.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/11/2019	1.50	1,342.50	Draft inquiry emails to USCIS and DOJ; review responses from USCIS; correspondence with common interest counsel and various class members; review Oct. 30 DOJ report and draft response/identify issues for court.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/12/2019	3.40	2,414.00	Address MAVNI naturalization application processing issues/questions/concerns, including communications with MAVNIs and others.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/12/2019	1.50	1,342.50	Review Nio Class counsel inbox.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/13/2019	0.60	300.00	Review Nio Class counsel inbox.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/13/2019	0.50	250.00	Review and analyze information from class members, Defendants' October 30 report, and draft Plaintiffs' response to report; correspondence with class members re: USCIS responses, status/issues, and/or next steps.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/13/2019	7.90	5,609.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members and emails to USCIS/DOJ.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/13/2019	4.50	4,027.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including review of emails from MAVNIs and call with common interest counsel; work on response to six-week report.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/14/2019	5.90	5,280.50	Address response re October 30 Report; address correspondence w. DOJ.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	11/14/2019	1.10	1,314.50	Review Nio Class counsel inbox.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/14/2019	0.30	150.00	Review and analyze information from class members, Defendants' October 30 report, and draft Plaintiffs' response to report; correspondence with class members re: USCIS responses, status/issues, and/or next steps.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/14/2019	8.10	5,751.00	Address MAVNI N-400 issues/updates/concerns, including calls re named plaintiff; finalize response to latest government report.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/15/2019	6.50	5,817.50	Edits and revisions to Response to October 30 Report.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	11/15/2019	1.80	2,151.00	Prepare response to Defendants' status report.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	11/15/2019	0.40	284.00	Review Nio Class counsel inbox.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/15/2019	0.40	200.00	Review team comments/edits to draft response; finalize response and coordinate filing; confer with team members re: same; respond to various class member inquiries / correspondence regarding status, next steps, delays; confer with J. Wollenberg re: same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/15/2019	7.10	5,041.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including emails to MAVNIs and common interest counsel and draft emails to USCIS/DOJ.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/17/2019	3.50	3,132.50	Address Nio inquiries to USCIS.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	11/18/2019	0.90	1,075.50	Review Nio Class Counsel inbox; Update MAVNI website.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/18/2019	1.00	500.00	

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/18/2019	4.60	3,266.00	Review class member inquiries and follow-up correspondence; draft emails to USCIS and opposing counsel re: individual class members; confer/correspond with J. Wollenberg, D. Baruch re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/18/2019	2.50	2,237.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including emails from MAVNIs and discussions with team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	11/19/2019	1.30	1,553.50	Address status and strategy and responses to DOJ and USCIS.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/19/2019	0.40	200.00	Review Nio Class counsel inbox.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/19/2019	3.60	2,556.00	Review DOJ filing and updates to status reports; confer with team re: same and upcoming status conference; review and respond to various class member inquiries; draft and send emails to USCIS and opposing counsel re: individual class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/19/2019	1.20	1,074.00	Review Defendants' court-ordered response regarding issues identified by Plaintiffs.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/19/2019	3.20	2,864.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	11/20/2019	4.80	5,736.00	Review DOJ report; prepare for status hearing; status hearing at USDC; correspondence w. DOJ.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	11/20/2019	3.10	2,201.00	Prepare for and attend status hearing; prepare correspondence relating to mediation.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/20/2019	7.20	5,112.00	Prep for and participate in status hearing; correspondence with class members / review inquiries; draft and send emails to USCIS/DOJ re: various individual class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/20/2019	4.30	3,848.50	Prepare for and attend status hearing.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/20/2019	2.90	2,595.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing updates/issues/concerns.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/21/2019	4.50	3,195.00	Confer with J. Wollenberg re: DOJ / USCIS updates for class members; discuss and prepare responses to various class member and common interest counsel inquiries; review USCIS responses to inquiries and draft / send follow-up correspondence to USCIS and opposing counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	11/21/2019	1.00	1,195.00	Address status and DOJ correspondence.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/21/2019	0.60	300.00	Update MAVNI website.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/21/2019	4.50	4,027.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including call with N. Raol and emails and discussions with MAVNIs.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	11/22/2019	0.20	100.00	Review MAVNI website updates.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/22/2019	2.60	2,327.00	Address N-400 processing issues/updates/concerns.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/25/2019	1.50	1,065.00	Review correspondence from USCIS re: individual class member inquiries and follow-up re: same; internal correspondence re: Renaud declarations.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/25/2019	4.30	3,848.50	Address N-400 processing issues, including emails with MAVNIs and discussions with team members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/26/2019	2.80	1,988.00	Correspondence with class members, common interest counsel, J. Wollenberg re: various inquiries / status updates; review USCIS responses to individual class member inquiries; review DOJ supplemental filing and correspondence with team, common interest counsel re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/26/2019	3.50	3,132.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/27/2019	2.50	1,775.00	Correspondence with class members; review report and provide information / status updates; circulate Renaud declarations to individual counsel; quality check to ensure class member responses provided/updated and follow-up as needed.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	11/29/2019	0.50	447.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including emails to/from MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	11/30/2019	0.70	836.50	Address status and emails to USCIS.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	11/30/2019	0.40	284.00	Correspondence and follow-up with class member; draft email to USCIS and DOJ re: same and follow-up with D. Baruch re: same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/2/2019	2.40	1,704.00	Prepare draft emails to DOJ re: class members missing from report; email correspondence with USCIS, DOJ re: class member issues and follow-up with class members re; same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/2/2019	2.50	2,237.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including emails with MAVNIs. Review response from USCIS / DOJ and internal correspondence re: same; draft and send inquiry and background re: individual class member; email correspondence with class members re:
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/3/2019	3.50	2,485.00	interview, status, etc.; review inbox correspondence and follow-up as nec
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/3/2019	4.20	3,759.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/updates/concerns. Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including conversations with common interest counsel and review of draft to USCIS.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/4/2019	5.10	4,564.50	Draft and send emails to USCIS, DOJ re: class member inquiries; review USCIS responses; follow-up with / correspond with various class members re: status / next steps.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/4/2019	2.80	1,988.00	Confer with and review material / documents from class member re: N-426 RFE.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/4/2019	0.40	284.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with common interest counsel and review of response to USCIS.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/5/2019	7.80	6,981.00	Confer with team members re class member correspondence; correspond / confer with class members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/5/2019	3.00	2,130.00	Review inquiries / correspondence from various class members; respond and review documents / government reporting; correspondence/conferences with individual counsel, common interest counsel, J. Wollenberg re: same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/6/2019	2.80	1,988.00	Prepare/revise and send list of missing class members and info to DOJ (re: Dec. reporting).
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/6/2019	0.20	142.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/6/2019	7.20	6,444.00	Confer / updates re: class member naturalization status.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/7/2019	0.20	142.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/7/2019	4.50	4,027.50	Update MAVNI website.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	12/9/2019	2.20	1,100.00	Discuss updates to MAVNI website with J. Wollenberg.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	12/9/2019	0.60	300.00	Confer with J. Wollenberg, B. Mendelson re: outstanding tasks / website updates;
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/9/2019	2.40	1,704.00	correspond/confer with class members re: status and upcoming interview/questions. Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including call with MAVNI and discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/9/2019	3.80	3,401.00	Assist MAVNI N-400 processing fixes, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and others regarding application issues and USCIS common problems.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/9/2019	2.60	2,327.00	Correspondence re: info for class member / with common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/10/2019	0.20	142.00	Update MAVNI website.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	12/10/2019	0.70	350.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues and concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/10/2019	2.80	2,506.00	Update MAVNI website.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	12/11/2019	0.30	150.00	Identify prior DOJ statements re: individual class member and confer with individual counsel re:
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/11/2019	0.30	213.00	same.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/11/2019	1.20	1,074.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with common interest counsel and team members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/12/2019	2.50	1,775.00	Review inbox correspondence and follow-up/respond to class members; confer with J. Wollenberg re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/12/2019	3.50	3,132.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	12/13/2019	2.80	1,400.00	Analysis re Government's 6-week report; Update MAVNI website.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	12/13/2019	0.80	956.00	Address mediation inquiry from court.
					Revise / revise draft correspondence to court re: mediation; internal conferences with team members; correspondence with/review inquiries from class members and follow-up re: same; review
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/13/2019	3.40	2,414.00	USG report and analysis re: same; confer with B. Mendelson re: same
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/13/2019	2.20	1,969.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with common interest counsel, MAVNIs, and team members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/15/2019	0.20	179.00	Emails with common interest counsel regarding MAVNI N-400 processing problems.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/16/2019	2.70	1,917.00	Correspondence with various class members regarding inquiries/status update/next steps; review/analyze Defendants' Dec. 12 report on class members; address mediation.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/16/2019	1.70	1,521.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
					Correspondence with class members; review and analyze Defendants' Dec. 12 report - update and
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/17/2019	4.90	3,479.00	confer internally re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/17/2019	2.30	2,058.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including emails from MAVNIs.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	12/18/2019	3.00	1,500.00	Drafting summary of MAVNI N-400 problem.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	12/18/2019	0.90	450.00	Meet with J. Wollenberg to discuss MAVNI N-400 problem.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	12/18/2019	2.10	2,509.50	Review status and team meetings re next steps in litigation.
					Confer with class members re: status, next steps; draft emails to USCIS re: particular class
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/18/2019	2.50	1,775.00	members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/18/2019	4.50	4,027.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including updates from MAVNIs and common interest counsel and team meeting regarding next steps.
					Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including re plaintiff; discussions with MAVNIs;
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/19/2019	2.70	2,416.50	discussions with team members.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	12/19/2019	8.80	4,400.00	Draft summary of MAVNI N-400 problem.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/20/2019	0.40	284.00	Confer with K. Kaplan, others re: MAVNI case files.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	12/20/2019	5.40	2,700.00	Draft summary of N-400 issue; update MAVNI website.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/20/2019	1.20	852.00	Confer and correspond with various class members.
					Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including call with common interest counsel and
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/20/2019	3.50	3,132.50	discussions with MAVNIs and team members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/21/2019	1.50	1,342.50	Discuss MAVNI N-400 processing issues with common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/22/2019	0.60	537.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including issues for plaintiff.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	12/23/2019	0.90	1,075.50	Conference call w.common interest counsel re litigation strategy.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	12/23/2019	3.20	1,600.00	Review/edits to summaries of MAVNI N-400 problems.
					Confer with J. Wollenberg re: various individual MAVNI / class member inquiries, requests, updates;
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/23/2019	0.90	639.00	follow-up re: same.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
					Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including calls with common interest counsel and
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/23/2019	6.40	5,728.00	MAVNIs, discussions with team members, and emails from MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	12/24/2019	1.50	1,792.50	Address/research re MAVNI N-400 problem.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	12/24/2019	1.40	700.00	Prepare documentation for MAVNI N-400 complaint.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	12/24/2019	0.70	836.50	Address status and correspondence w. DOJ.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/24/2019	2.70	1,917.00	Correspondence with various class members re: status; confer with J. Wollenberg re: various outstanding items and class member / USCIS issues; draft and send emails to USCIS/DOJ.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/24/2019	5.90	5,280.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, discussions with common interest counsel and team members, and emails to USCIS/DOJ.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/25/2019	0.30	213.00	Review Nio class inbox.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/25/2019	0.50	447.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including emails with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	12/26/2019	2.40	2,868.00	Address MAVNI N-400 complaint.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	12/26/2019	2.90	1,450.00	Legal research regarding MAVNI N-400 issue.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/26/2019	3.80	3,401.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including emails with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	12/27/2019	1.80	2,151.00	Revisions to MAVNI summary.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/28/2019	2.70	2,416.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, team members, and DOJ/USCIS.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	12/30/2019	2.50	2,987.50	Further edits and revisions to MAVNI complaint; address emails to government.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	12/30/2019	0.60	300.00	Legal research regarding MAVNI N-400 problem.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/30/2019	2.40	1,704.00	Review and follow-up on various class member inquiries re: interview scheduling, follow-up and denials; draft and send emails to USCIS/DOJ re: issues for individual class members; correspondence re: class member RFE request.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/30/2019	3.30	2,953.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing and related issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	12/31/2019	0.40	284.00	Correspondence with and regarding class member RFE and USCIS follow-up post-interview.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	12/31/2019	3.40	3,043.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including emails with MAVNIs and common interest counsel; address MAVNI denial.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/2/2020	2.20	2,629.00	Address developments, court inquiry and mediation proposal.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/2/2020	1.50	1,065.00	Confer / correspondence with class members re: status, reporting by DOJ, and USCIS delays.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/2/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	1/3/2020	0.50	250.00	Legal research regarding MAVNI N-400 issues/delay problems.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/3/2020	1.20	1,434.00	Address developments and correspondence.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/3/2020	0.80	568.00	Correspondence with class members; review and respond to Nio inbox inquiries; draft and send emails to DOJ re: class member naturalization delays.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/3/2020	0.80	716.00	Address updates/issues/concerns re N-400 processing for various MAVNIs.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/4/2020	2.70	2,416.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/updates/concerns, including review of emails from MAVNIs and emails to team members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/5/2020	1.50	1,087.50	Send email to USCIS / DOJ re: class member issues; correspondence with class members re: various inquiries on USCIS status.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/5/2020	0.60	537.00	Prepare draft mediation submission.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	1/6/2020	0.50	250.00	Research regarding MAVNI N-400 complaint.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/6/2020	1.80	2,151.00	Address status and mediation position for JSR; address emails to DOJ and USCIS. Update December 12 reporting / tracking of class members with notes and identify info for individual counsel re: same; confer with D. Baruch and J. Wollenberg re: outstanding tasks, class member updates.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/6/2020	2.00	1,450.00	
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/6/2020	2.10	1,879.50	Review emails concerning N-400 processing issues and concerns.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/7/2020	1.80	2,151.00	Address mediation proposal, emails to USCIS, and strategy.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	1/7/2020	0.90	639.00	Prepare mediation proposal. Review correspondence from USCIS / DOJ and follow-up correspondence with class members; draft emails to USCIS and DOJ re: various individual class member issues/delays.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/7/2020	6.60	4,785.00	
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/8/2020	2.50	2,987.50	Address mediation submission; address MAVNI complaint; correspondence w. USCIS.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	1/8/2020	1.60	1,136.00	Prepare mediation proposal. Review and update draft mediation statement; confer with D. Baruch re: same; review DOJ draft; correspondence with class members; draft various emails to USCIS / DOJ re: various class member issues.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/8/2020	4.70	3,407.50	
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/9/2020	1.50	1,792.50	Address mediation and USCIS inquiries. Review updates re: various class members; correspondence and follow-up with numerous class members; draft emails to USCIS and DOJ for D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg review and confer with them re: same; send emails to USCIS and DOJ.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/9/2020	7.10	5,147.50	
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/9/2020	2.60	2,327.00	Discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel re N-400 processing issues. Review information re: various individual class members and correspondence/confer with them and/or individual counsel re: same; draft various emails to USCIS / DOJ re: class member inquiries/issues and correspond/confer with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg re: same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/10/2020	6.30	4,567.50	
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/10/2020	1.00	1,195.00	Address developments; inquiries to USCIS; mediation position.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	1/10/2020	0.30	219.00	Analyze Defendants' status update.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/10/2020	3.80	3,401.00	Analyze and address N-400 processing issues, including Government report to Court.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/11/2020	0.70	507.50	Correspondence with class member; draft email to USCIS / DOJ re: same. Communications with class members and draft / send emails to USCIS and DOJ; review Nio inbox and correspondence with J. Wollenberg re: same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/12/2020	3.70	2,682.50	
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/12/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Review MAVNI emails re N-400 processing problems. Prep for and participate in status conference with magistrate judge (combined with Calixto and Kirwa); correspondence with class members; draft emails to USCIS / DOJ re: individual class member issues re: N400; confer with J. Wollenberg re: various issues
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/13/2020	4.60	3,335.00	
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/13/2020	3.00	3,585.00	Mediation status conference before Judge Harvey; address correspondence w. USCIS. Prepare for and attend mediation status conference; discuss case with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, N. Raol, and B. Mendelson.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	1/13/2020	2.40	1,752.00	
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	1/13/2020	2.00	1,130.00	Attend status hearing regarding scheduling dates for mediation.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/13/2020	0.80	716.00	Prepare for and attend Mediation Session.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/14/2020	0.50	597.50	Address correspondence w. USCIS. Correspond/confer with various class members re: status/inquiries re: next steps/issues and delays; draft/send email re: individual class members to USCIS / DOJ regarding delays in oath ceremony scheduling, interview, etc.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/14/2020	3.50	2,537.50	

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/14/2020	3.50	3,132.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/15/2020	1.10	1,314.50	Address mediation, client inquiries, and USCIS/DoJ correspondence.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	1/15/2020	0.30	219.00	Email correspondence regarding mediation and status hearings.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/15/2020	5.90	4,277.50	Correspondence with class members and named plaintiff updates; draft and send individual inquiries / issues for class members to USCIS / DOJ; internal correspondence re: same; review and update spreadsheet/tracker for class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/15/2020	2.30	2,058.50	MAVNI N-400 processing delays emails and other updates.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/16/2020	2.50	1,812.50	Review responses/correspondence from USCIS re: various class members; follow-up with class members re: same and draft/send follow-up inquiries to USCIS / DOJ; review DOJ correspondence to court re: reporting; internal correspondence re MAVNI issues/complaints.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/16/2020	2.30	2,748.50	Multiple emails to USCIS; correspondence w. Court re reporting.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	1/16/2020	0.20	146.00	Email correspondence regarding reporting requirements.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	1/16/2020	0.70	395.50	Update MAVNI website.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/16/2020	4.30	3,848.50	Address N-400 processing issues/emails/updates.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/17/2020	0.40	478.00	Address correspondence w. DOJ/USCIS.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/17/2020	4.50	3,262.50	Correspondence with class members; draft/follow-up with USCIS/DOJ re: same (oath ceremony details); confer with team, naturalized class member.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/17/2020	4.30	3,848.50	Address MAVNI naturalization processing issues, complaints, and concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel and team members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/18/2020	2.60	1,885.00	Review and respond to class member emails; update class member spreadsheet.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/19/2020	0.40	290.00	Class member correspondence.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/20/2020	6.10	4,422.50	Correspondence with class members and follow-up re: USCIS responses; draft emails for USCIS / DOJ re: class member issues; conferences with class members, common interest counsel, J. Wollenberg re: various class members passing 120 days.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/20/2020	4.80	4,296.00	Address N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/21/2020	0.90	1,075.50	Status hearing before Judge Huvelle; correspondence w. USCIS/DOJ.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/21/2020	5.10	3,697.50	Status conference with Judge Huvelle re: same; draft response to DOJ re: 1/10 update to court and reinstatement issues; correspondence with class members; draft/send class member issues / inquiries to USCIS and DOJ; internal correspondence re: above items
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/21/2020	1.70	1,521.50	Prepare for and attend status hearing re Nio and Calixto matters.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/21/2020	4.50	4,027.50	Review emails regarding and address MAVNI N-400 processing and delays issues/updates/concerns.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/22/2020	3.60	2,610.00	Correspondence with class members; draft / revise emails to DOJ re: specific class member issues; internal correspondence re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/22/2020	1.50	1,342.50	MAVNI N-400 processing issues/concerns/updates.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/23/2020	0.30	358.50	Address correspondence w. USCIS and follow-up.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/23/2020	1.40	1,015.00	Confer with class members; follow-up Nio inbox correspondence re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/23/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including emails from MAVNIs and discussions with team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/24/2020	0.80	956.00	Address strategy and correspondence w. DOJ/USCIS.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	1/24/2020	1.30	734.50	Update MAVNI website.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/24/2020	2.20	1,595.00	Internal correspondence re: emails to USCIS re: specific class members; finalize and send emails to USCIS and DOJ; review and respond to class member inquiries/correspondence in Nio inbox.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/24/2020	3.30	2,953.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and team members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/25/2020	0.30	217.50	Class member correspondence.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/25/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Review emails re N-400 processing and delay issues. Correspondence with class members re: status of N400 and potential issues/delays; draft email to
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/26/2020	1.10	797.50	USCIS/DOJ re specific class member delay.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/26/2020	0.50	447.50	Review emails re MAVNI N-400 processing issues.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/27/2020	1.30	1,553.50	Review MAVNI complaint. Review correspondence from USCIS re: individual class members; follow-up with class members re: same; draft email to USCIS/DOJ regarding individual class member inquiry; correspondence
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/27/2020	3.90	2,827.50	with class members via Nio inbox. Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including emails to/from MAVNIs and common interest
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/27/2020	0.50	447.50	counsel and review of emails from USCIS. Draft/send emails to USCIS / DOJ regarding class member issues at USCIS; correspondence with
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/28/2020	2.50	1,812.50	class members (Nio inbox). Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns regarding N-400 processing and delays, including
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/28/2020	2.70	2,416.50	discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/29/2020	0.80	580.00	Class member correspondence; follow-up re: USCIS responses.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/29/2020	2.90	2,595.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussion with team members,
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/30/2020	2.10	1,522.50	Class member correspondence and follow-up. Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/30/2020	3.80	3,401.00	counsel, and team members. Meet with J. Wollenberg re: materials for MAVNI complaint; address materials and review/revise
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	1/31/2020	6.40	3,616.00	summaries of MAVNI problems.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	1/31/2020	0.40	478.00	Address correspondence and soldier inquiries.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	1/31/2020	3.50	2,537.50	Class member correspondence; prepare emails to DOJ/USCIS; update spreadsheet. Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with DOJ/USCIS, MAVNIs, team
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	1/31/2020	3.50	3,132.50	members, and common interest counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	2/2/2020	1.10	1,314.50	Address response for class member and DOJ correspondence.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/2/2020	0.50	362.50	Correspond and follow-up with class members regarding delays after N400 interview. Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including review of MAVNI and common interest counsel
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/2/2020	2.90	2,595.50	emails.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	2/3/2020	1.20	1,434.00	Correspondence w. USCIS; address class member inquiries; address mediation. Draft and send inquiries on behalf of class members to Nio inbox; follow-up with class members re:
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/3/2020	1.80	1,305.00	same and status/provide update. Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/3/2020	3.30	2,953.50	common interest counsel. Internal conference re: various class member issues and next steps/strategy re: delays, implications
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/4/2020	5.90	4,277.50	re: inaccuracies; review transcripts, government statements re: USCIS delays and draft report for
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	2/4/2020	0.40	478.00	Court re: delays/non-responsiveness; correspondence with MAVNIs. Discuss mediation statements.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	2/4/2020	3.30	2,409.00	Discuss mediation strategy with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, and N. Raol; prepare mediation statement.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/4/2020	2.90	2,595.50	Address mediation proposal; address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and team members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/5/2020	4.50	3,262.50	Review transcripts, government statements re: USCIS delays and draft report for Court re: delays/non-responsiveness; conferences with various class members; review Nio inbox responses and follow-up correspondence with class members re: same.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	2/5/2020	1.00	1,195.00	Address mediation statement and correspondence w. DOJ/USCIS.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	2/5/2020	2.20	1,606.00	Prepare Mediation Statement.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/5/2020	3.20	2,864.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing problems, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	2/6/2020	1.80	1,017.00	Address next steps re MAVNI complaint.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	2/6/2020	7.60	5,548.00	Discuss case with J. Wollenberg; prepare Mediation Statement.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/6/2020	4.20	3,045.00	Correspond and confer with various class members and individual counsel re: USCIS interview and oath ceremony delays; follow-up re: updates on individual lawsuits; confer with K. Kaplan re: Nio class member status / population re: mediation statement.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/6/2020	2.90	2,595.50	Address N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	2/7/2020	1.30	1,553.50	Address mediation response and statement; address DOJ correspondence and strategy.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/7/2020	0.40	290.00	Confer with class members regarding USCIS updates, next steps and delays with naturalization application adjudication.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/7/2020	3.90	3,490.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with team members, common interest counsel, and MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	2/8/2020	3.40	4,063.00	Address mediation statement and correspondence w. DOJ.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/8/2020	6.00	4,350.00	Review and respond to various class member inquiries regarding various issues relating to USCIS application, delays, status; confer with J. Wollenberg re: same; draft/send inquiries for class members / issues and concerns re: delays to USCIS and DOJ.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/8/2020	4.00	3,580.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing, including call with N. Raol and emails to MAVNIs, common interest counsel, team members, and DOJ/USCIS.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	2/9/2020	1.00	1,195.00	Multiple emails re USCIS and mediation statement.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	2/9/2020	2.40	1,752.00	Prepare Mediation Statement.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/9/2020	0.50	362.50	Email USCIS / DOJ re: class member issues and delays with naturalization adjudication.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/9/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address MAVNI concerns/updates/issues with N-400 processing, including emails to DOJ, USCIS, and team members; review and revise mediation statement.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/10/2020	3.90	2,827.50	Review/revise draft mediation statement; review comments; finalize for submission (time split with Kirwa); conference with class members re: status update and concerns re: USCIS delays; draft/revise and send inquiries to USCIS re: class member delays.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	2/10/2020	2.20	2,629.00	Further edits and finalize mediation statement; confer w. team re strategy; correspondence w. DOJ.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	2/10/2020	1.10	803.00	Prepare Mediation Statement; discuss case with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, and N. Raol.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/10/2020	5.00	4,475.00	Address N-400 processing problems, including communications from MAVNIs; address mediation statement.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	2/11/2020	0.50	597.50	Confer w. common interest counsel re strategy.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/11/2020	0.80	716.00	Address MAVNI N-400 updates and issues, including discussions with common interest counsel, team members, and MAVNIs.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	2/12/2020	0.40	226.00	Update MAVNI website.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/12/2020	0.30	217.50	Correspondence with class members re: status of applications, timeline, and potential concerns.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/12/2020	0.50	447.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues.
					Confer and correspondence with various class members regarding USCIS naturalization application issues and next steps; review class member documents/prior correspondence; confer with J. Wollenberg re: same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/13/2020	5.10	3,697.50	Wollenberg re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/13/2020	3.50	3,132.50	Calls with MAVNIs re N-400 processing issues; discuss MAVNI issues with N. Raol; address MAVNI N-400 processing problems.
					Confer with J. Wollenberg re: various individual class member issues, inquiries, and responses; correspondence with class members regarding status, next steps; confer with class member regarding upcoming interview.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/14/2020	4.20	3,045.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including review of emails from MAVNIs and communication with common interest counsel and team members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/14/2020	2.40	2,148.00	Correspondence from individual counsel to class member re: initiation of deportation proceedings; review related documents; review correspondence in Nio inbox.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/15/2020	0.50	362.50	Confer with J. Wollenberg re: class member inquiries, status, and updates; respond to various class member inquiries and updates (re: USCIS application delays, reporting); confer with common interest counsel re: MAVNI issues/individual class members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/17/2020	3.40	2,465.00	Address N-400 issues, including review of numerous MAVNI emails and communications with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/17/2020	6.80	6,086.00	Confer with Judge Harvey, internal team (re: mediation statement - time split with Kirwa); draft various inquiries to USCIS re: delays in interviews, oath ceremonies, decisions; correspondence with class members re: various issues with naturalization applications.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/18/2020	4.10	2,972.50	Mediation call w. Judge Harvey; address strategy.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	2/18/2020	0.80	956.00	Address upcoming mediation, including call with Magistrate Judge Harvey; address MAVNI N-400 issues.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/18/2020	3.50	3,132.50	Confer and correspondence with various class members regarding status, next steps, and concerns re: USCIS issues; draft/revise/send inquiries to USCIS/DOJ re: class members; correspondence with individual counsel re: Nio case and court orders; review DOJ material.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/19/2020	6.10	4,422.50	Address correspondence to USCIS.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	2/19/2020	0.60	717.00	Correspondence/confer with numerous class members regarding status, govt reporting, USCIS inquiries and responses, and issues relating to naturalization delays / USCIS helpline and field office statements; review various issues, identify examples, and prepare summaries.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/20/2020	8.60	6,235.00	Address N-400 issues.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/20/2020	3.90	3,490.50	Confer with class members regarding status, updates, and strategy re: next steps; correspondence with class members re: status, updates, USCIS responses, and next steps; correspondence with multiple individual class member counsel regarding government.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/21/2020	2.50	1,812.50	Address N-400 problems, including sessions with N. Raol.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/21/2020	4.50	4,027.50	Review and respond / correspondence with class members regarding government reporting, USCIS status; follow-up internal correspondence re: same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/23/2020	1.50	1,087.50	

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/24/2020	0.40	290.00	Correspondence with class members regarding status / updates on naturalization application; review and monitor Nio class counsel inbox.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/25/2020	0.80	580.00	Confer with class members regarding status and issue with USCIS naturalization application delays / updates from field office and military helpdesks.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/25/2020	3.20	2,864.00	Address N-400 problems. Review correspondence and follow-up inquiries / updates re: class members; draft/revise and send inquiries to USCIS and government counsel re: delays / class member issues; confer with J.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/26/2020	6.20	4,495.00	Wollenberg, correspondence with individual class member counsel.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	2/26/2020	1.00	565.00	Update MAVNI website.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/26/2020	4.30	3,848.50	Address MAVNI N-400 issues. Draft and revise inquiries for USCIS and govt counsel re: various Nio class member delays / issues; conference and correspondence with various class members re: next steps, status, and delays;
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/27/2020	3.90	2,827.50	correspondence with individual counsel for class members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	2/27/2020	0.60	717.00	Address DOJ correspondence.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/27/2020	4.30	3,848.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues. Correspondence with individual class member counsel re: USCIS RFE/NOID; internal correspondence re: class member inquiries; draft/revise follow-up and inquiry to USCIS re: class member issues; review individual class member correspondence in Nio inbox.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	2/28/2020	1.30	942.50	Address DOJ correspondence and mediation.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	2/28/2020	0.50	597.50	Address DOJ correspondence and mediation.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	2/28/2020	6.20	5,549.00	Address MAVNI inquiries and updates re N-400 processing issues.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/1/2020	1.20	870.00	Correspondence with class members regarding updates re: USCIS naturalization application/status and follow-up re: same; monitor and respond to class member inquiries through Nio inbox.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/1/2020	3.60	3,222.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including review of MAVNI emails, USCIS emails, and common interest counsel's communications; discussions with MAVNIs re same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/2/2020	0.70	507.50	Nio inbox correspondence with class members; internal follow-up re: USCIS issues.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/2/2020	0.50	447.50	Prepare for upcoming mediation.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/2/2020	4.90	4,385.50	Address MAVNI N-400 application processing updates/concerns/issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/3/2020	1.70	1,232.50	Review responses to inquiries from USCIS; correspondence with various class members regarding updates / next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/3/2020	2.80	2,506.00	Prepare for and attend Mediation Session.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/3/2020	3.20	2,864.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs re issues/updates/concerns.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/4/2020	3.40	2,465.00	Correspondence and conferences with class members regarding USCIS updates and naturalization application status; monitor and respond to Nio inbox inquiries.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/4/2020	2.80	2,506.00	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and others.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	3/5/2020	6.80	8,126.00	Mediation conference in District Court.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	3/5/2020	5.70	4,161.00	Prepare for and attend Mediation Session.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/5/2020	7.10	5,147.50	Prep for and attend mediation session with Judge Harvey.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/5/2020	1.10	797.50	Correspondence with class members regarding USCIS updates / requests for new N-426; review and provide information from DOJ reports / status updates.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/5/2020	2.70	2,416.50	Prepare for and attend Mediation Session.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/5/2020	1.70	1,521.50	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/6/2020	1.10	797.50	Correspondence with class member and USCIS regarding interview scheduling; monitor / respond to Nio inbox inquiries.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/6/2020	2.70	2,416.50	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns regarding N-400 processing delays.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/7/2020	0.50	447.50	Emails with MAVNI and common interest counsel regarding N-400 processing problem.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/9/2020	4.60	3,335.00	Prepare for and attend status conference with J. Huvelle (time split with Calixto / joint conference); review court order; correspondence with various class members re: USCIS reporting, issues with N400 delays; correspondence with USCIS/DOJ.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	3/9/2020	2.50	2,987.50	Status conference before Judge Huvelle; address USCIS correspondence.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	3/9/2020	2.40	1,752.00	Prepare for and attend Nio/Calixto status hearing.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/9/2020	1.30	1,163.50	Prepare for and attend status hearing.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/9/2020	3.20	2,864.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/10/2020	4.30	3,117.50	Correspondence with Nio class members - provide updates from USCIS; review/discuss USCIS delays and statements to soldiers and next steps; conference with class member re: same; draft and send multiple class member inquiries to USCIS re: various issues.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	3/10/2020	6.10	3,446.50	Meet with J. Wollenberg to discuss MAVNI complaint; draft summary of MAVNI problem.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	3/10/2020	1.00	1,195.00	Address DOJ/USCIS correspondence and status.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/10/2020	4.20	3,759.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	3/11/2020	8.90	5,028.50	Draft MAVNI complaint against USCIS.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	3/11/2020	1.00	1,195.00	Address communications w. USCIS and mediation position.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/11/2020	3.10	2,247.50	Correspondence with several class members regarding USCIS status / reporting and next steps; review documents from class members and follow-up re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/11/2020	4.20	3,759.00	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with common interest counsel and MAVNIs; address Nio term sheet for mediation efforts.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/12/2020	5.20	3,770.00	Confer with class members regarding next steps / status and USCIS responses; review Defendants' proposed term sheet; confer with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg re: mark-up and prepare same;
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	3/12/2020	8.50	4,802.50	correspondence with J. Harvey's chambers, opposing counsel re: upcoming
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	3/12/2020	2.50	2,987.50	Draft MAVNI complaint against USCIS.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/12/2020	6.20	5,549.00	Address mediation response and correspondence w. USCIS.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	3/13/2020	3.90	2,203.50	Discuss and prepare response re Nio mediation term sheet; address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/questions/updates.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/13/2020	5.50	3,987.50	Address class member's complaint concerning USCIS.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	3/13/2020	4.50	5,377.50	Mediation session with Magistrate Judge Harvey; correspondence with class members regarding USCIS responses (via email to class counsel and to soldiers) re: various issues; confer with soldier re: USCIS interviewing improper request / letter for new N-426.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	3/13/2020	2.90	2,117.00	Mediation session (telephonic) with Judge Harvey.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/13/2020	5.00	4,475.00	Prepare for and attend telephonic mediation.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/13/2020	2.60	2,327.00	Prepare for and attend mediation sessions (by telephone) and discuss same with internal team.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/14/2020	0.50	362.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing problems.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/14/2020	0.80	716.00	Confer with class member regarding upcoming interview and correspondence with common interest counsel re: delays / next steps.
					Address MAVNI N-400 processing updates/issues/concerns.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/15/2020	0.30	268.50	Address N-400 processing problem.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	3/16/2020	0.30	169.50	Update MAVNI website.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/16/2020	1.40	1,015.00	Correspondence with class members regarding delays in USCIS review/application adjudication; provide updates to Nio class members from Defendants' reporting.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/16/2020	3.20	2,864.00	Address MAVNI N-400 related issues/updates/concerns.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/17/2020	1.70	1,232.50	Correspondence with class members re: USCIS updates / rescheduling and cancellations; confer with class member re: USCIS delays; monitor and response to Nio inbox inquiries.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/17/2020	3.70	3,311.50	Address MAVNI questions/issues/updates/concerns re N-400 processing.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	3/18/2020	0.40	292.00	Mediation conference call.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/18/2020	0.60	435.00	Review updates from Nio class members re: USCIS status and correspondence re: next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/18/2020	0.40	358.00	Address MAVNI N-400 issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/18/2020	3.20	2,864.00	More discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel re N-400 processing issues.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/19/2020	2.30	1,667.50	Correspondence with class members regarding multiple interview cancellations, delays and outstanding issues re: USCIS withholding interviews / not scheduling because of review; review emails to Nio inbox and respond / provide updates to class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/19/2020	3.80	3,401.00	Address MAVNI N-400 updates and concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/20/2020	3.90	2,827.50	Confer with J. Wollenberg re: various class member delays and issues; correspondence with individual class counsel re: same and updates re: naturalization; confer with multiple class members re: delays or USCIS N-426 requests; correspondence with class members re updates.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	3/20/2020	0.20	146.00	Prepare mediation correspondence.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/20/2020	2.90	2,595.50	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including call with N. Raol and emails with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	3/21/2020	3.50	1,977.50	Address materials related to class member complaint against USCIS.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/21/2020	1.70	1,521.50	Address N-400 issues for MAVNIs.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/22/2020	3.20	2,864.00	Address MAVNI N-400 questions and concerns.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/23/2020	0.80	580.00	Correspondence with class members re: USCIS updates; confer with individual class member counsel re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/23/2020	4.20	3,759.00	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns re N-400s; address mediation issues.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/24/2020	1.80	1,305.00	Correspondence with class members - review inquiries and provide updates (including USCIS responses to inquiries).
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/25/2020	0.80	580.00	Correspond and provide updates / information to class members; review class member request from USCIS re: new n-426 and follow-up re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/25/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address MAVNI N-400-related issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel; review MAVNI complaint re N-400 delays.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/26/2020	7.30	6,533.50	Address MAVNI N-400 issues; address MAVNI N-400 complaint.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	3/27/2020	0.20	146.00	Review mediation correspondence.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/27/2020	1.60	1,160.00	Conference with magistrate judge re: settlement (split with Nio, Kirwa, Calixto); respond to and follow-up with various class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/27/2020	4.90	4,385.50	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns; address mediation efforts.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/28/2020	8.20	7,339.00	Address MAVNI N-400 issues; MAVNI N-400 complaint.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	3/29/2020	3.50	4,182.50	Address strategy for and assistance to class members facing delays.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/29/2020	8.90	7,965.50	Address MAVNI N-400 issues, including discussions with MAVNIs; address MAVNI N-400 complaint.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/30/2020	1.20	870.00	Internal conference re: various outstanding class member issues and next steps; respond to class members re: delays and USCIS updates.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/30/2020	4.50	4,027.50	Address MAVNI N-400 issues; address MAVNI N-400 complaint.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	3/31/2020	3.50	1,977.50	Update MAVNI website; legal research regarding actions against USCIS.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	3/31/2020	0.80	956.00	Address strategy and confer w. J. Wollenberg.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	3/31/2020	1.80	1,305.00	Correspondence with class members; review delay issues raised by individual counsel and next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	3/31/2020	6.20	5,549.00	Address MAVNI N-400 issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel. Correspondence with class members and individual counsel regarding status and government reporting.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/1/2020	0.80	580.00	Address MAVNI N-400 updates/issues/concerns, including call with MAVNI and emails with common interest counsel. MAVNIs, and team members; prepare declaration for Nio class member re "pending" nature of application.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/1/2020	3.40	3,043.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel and team members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/2/2020	3.50	3,132.50	Conference with class member regarding status and USCIS naturalization application / DOJ reporting, USCIS responses to inquiries; correspondence with class members / individual counsel regarding status and next steps; correspondence with magistrate judge's chambers re mediation.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/3/2020	1.30	942.50	Address N-400 processing issues, including discussions with common interest counsel, team members, and MAVNIs.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/3/2020	3.40	3,043.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing and related issues, including discussions with MAVNIs.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/4/2020	0.50	447.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing and related issues, including discussions with MAVNIs.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/5/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Address MAVNI N-400 questions, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/6/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Address N-400 processing issues/questions/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/8/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address N-400 processing questions/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and team members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/9/2020	1.80	1,305.00	Correspondence with class members regarding status, USCIS delays, and next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/9/2020	2.90	2,595.50	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns re N-400 processing, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel and review of Government's report.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/11/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	4/13/2020	1.30	1,553.50	Address class member complaints against USCIS and confer w. J. Wollenberg re strategy.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/13/2020	2.30	1,667.50	Correspondence with class members re: status, next steps; correspondence with individual counsel for class member and follow-up re: same; monitor and respond to Nio inbox inquiries.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/13/2020	2.90	2,595.50	Prepare declaration for Nio class member; address MAVNI N-400 questions/concerns/updates.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/14/2020	3.40	3,043.00	Address MAVNI next steps; address N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/14/2020	2.10	1,522.50	Confer with J. Wollenberg; confer with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, K. Kaplan re: next steps and strategy; review notes and correspondence to identify categories of remaining class members; review incoming class member correspondence re: status inquiry.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	4/14/2020	1.70	1,241.00	Discuss case with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, and N. Raol; prepare email communication.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	4/14/2020	1.60	1,912.00	Address staffing and strategy; team meeting.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/15/2020	4.60	3,335.00	Confer with J. Wollenberg regarding various class member updates; correspondence with various class members re: pending naturalization applications and status / delays; advise re: same and next steps/updates re: litigation status, DOJ reporting.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/15/2020	3.70	3,311.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing delays, including review of non-interviewed class members with N. Raol and discussions with common interest counsel and MAVNIs.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/16/2020	0.90	652.50	Confer with J. Wollenberg re: status of remaining class members; correspondence with class members re: status/next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/16/2020	2.10	1,879.50	Address N-400 processing issues, including discussions with N. Raol re non-naturalized class members' issues.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/17/2020	1.10	797.50	Review Nio inbox correspondence; respond to various class member inquiries and advise re: naturalization application/interview delays.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/18/2020	0.40	358.00	Emails from Nio class members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/20/2020	0.20	145.00	Review court's order; internal correspondence re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/20/2020	2.40	2,148.00	Emails with Nio class members, team members, and common interest counsel; assess MAVNI status/projects.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	4/21/2020	1.00	565.00	Update MAVNI website.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/21/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Address Court scheduling order and mediation emails; discussions with MAVNIs, common interest counsel, and team members re N-400 processing.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/22/2020	8.80	6,380.00	Review defendants' reporting re: current Nio class members; correspondence with class members re: naturalization application status, next steps, communications/notices from USCIS; confer with J. Wollenberg, individual class counsel re: same and next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/22/2020	15.50	13,872.50	Assess remaining class members' needs with N. Raol; discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel re N-400 processing delays and issues.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/23/2020	3.60	2,610.00	Communication with numerous class members - regarding naturalization applications and next steps/delays; review defendants' reporting re: current Nio class members and update information re: class member delays.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/23/2020	1.80	1,611.00	Analyze remaining Nio class members' needs with N. Raol; address MAVNI N-400 processing issues and concerns, including discussions with common interest counsel, team members, and MAVNIs.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/24/2020	2.80	2,506.00	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including team email re outstanding projects and emails with common interest counsel, MAVNIs, and team members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/27/2020	1.20	870.00	Correspondence with class members regarding status of naturalization applications, next steps and update status/files re: same; correspondence with individual counsel to class member.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/27/2020	1.30	1,163.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with team member and common interest counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	4/28/2020	0.90	1,075.50	Review correspondence and class member status.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/28/2020	1.60	1,160.00	Confer/correspondence with individual counsel for class member with delayed naturalization application processing; correspondence with J. Wollenberg re: same; correspondence with class members regarding next steps / defendants' reporting.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/28/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns re N-400 processing, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	4/29/2020	1.30	1,553.50	Review status and strategy call w. counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/29/2020	4.80	4,296.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and team members and common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	4/30/2020	3.10	2,247.50	Review updates / correspondence from class members; update internal tracking sheet; follow-up correspondence with class members regarding various matters related to pending naturalization applications, including delay in receiving RFE, responses from USCIS.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	4/30/2020	2.70	2,416.50	Address MAVNI N-400 issues/questions/concerns about delays and next steps, including discussions with common interest counsel and team members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/1/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with N. Raol and new team member re projects.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/4/2020	2.60	1,885.00	Correspondence with class members regarding scheduling delays and next steps; internal follow-up re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/4/2020	0.70	626.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing delay updates, including discussions with N. Raol and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/5/2020	1.90	1,700.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing problems, including project teams for interview cases and decision cases.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/6/2020	3.20	2,320.00	Confer with class members re: naturalization delays and USCIS updates/responses; correspondence with class members, C. Rush re: same and next steps; analyze class member reporting re: class members for guidance.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/6/2020	1.40	1,253.00	Address N-400 processing issues, including discussions with common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/7/2020	7.50	5,437.50	Confer with J. Wollenberg re: various class member inquiries, issues, and responses; prepare and draft next steps for class members facing delays at various stages with naturalization adjudication; correspondence with numerous class members regarding status.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/7/2020	4.80	4,296.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with team members, common interest counsel, and MAVNIs.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/8/2020	5.10	3,697.50	Internal conferences with attorneys regarding matter background, status, and class member delays and next steps; revise and circulate next steps/outline for class members facing delays at various stages with naturalization adjudication; correspondence.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	5/8/2020	0.70	836.50	Address correspondence and status.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/8/2020	4.50	4,027.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including emails with MAVNIs and preparation for interview and decision project teams work.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/10/2020	4.60	3,335.00	Review and identify circumstances for remaining class members facing USCIS delays / pending naturalization applications; confer with J. Wollenberg and discussions re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/10/2020	5.00	4,475.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues; prepare information re remaining class members for project teams.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	5/11/2020	0.80	956.00	Address strategy and analysis re class member.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/11/2020	4.20	3,045.00	Prep for and confer regarding Nio class members awaiting interview; follow-up correspondence and revise/update draft summaries/outlines: re same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/11/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Training/planning re tracking and assistance for remaining class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/11/2020	1.50	1,342.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/questions, including discussion with common interest counsel.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/12/2020	1.20	870.00	Review USCIS responses; follow-up correspondence re: same; confer / correspondence with class members regarding USCIS delays; correspondence with M. Kiziltay Carter re: identification of Nio class members not on 2/19 report who need to be added to next report.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/12/2020	1.50	1,342.50	Address N-400 processing problems/questions. Prep for and internal conference regarding Nio class members with pending applications and next steps; follow-up correspondence with class members and internally re: same; review summary of soldiers identified as Nio class members (no longer Kirwa).
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/13/2020	3.60	2,610.00	Planning/training re assisting and tracking remaining class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/13/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Review and comment on draft complaint for Nio class member and discussion with team and common interest counsel re same; address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/13/2020	3.40	3,043.00	Conference and correspondence with class members awaiting USCIS interviews for naturalization applications; review updates and follow-up correspondence from class members and draft response/responses to class members; internal correspondence re: same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/14/2020	3.80	2,755.00	Address MAVNI soldier/class member litigation strategy.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	5/14/2020	0.80	956.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/14/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address MAVNI soldier position and team call re same.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	5/15/2020	1.00	1,195.00	Prepare draft emails and updates for class members awaiting interviews and various internal correspondence re: same; draft email re: class members who need to be added to defendants' upcoming reporting and follow-up re: same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/15/2020	1.70	1,232.50	Address class member problems with N-400 processing, including assistance with complaint.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/15/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Address class member litigation strategy.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	5/18/2020	0.70	836.50	Correspondence with numerous class members regarding status/outstanding questions, review prior communications, documents re: same, and internal follow-up regarding next steps.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/18/2020	5.20	3,770.00	Address Nio class members' updates and concerns, including onboarding additional team members to help.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/18/2020	2.20	1,969.00	Confer with class member, C. Rush, and J. Wollenberg; correspondence with numerous class members regarding status/outstanding questions, review prior communications, documents re: same, and internal follow-up regarding next steps; confer with J. Wollenberg.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/19/2020	5.10	3,697.50	Call w. team re MAVNI class member litigation options.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	5/19/2020	0.40	478.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and team members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/19/2020	1.10	984.50	Address class member litigation strategy and confer w. J. Wollenberg re same.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	5/20/2020	1.20	1,434.00	Correspondence with numerous class members regarding status/outstanding questions, review prior communications, documents re: same, and internal follow-up regarding next steps; review court's order.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/20/2020	4.10	2,972.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing updates/issues/concerns.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/20/2020	0.80	716.00	Update MAVNI website.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	5/21/2020	0.60	339.00	Confer with class member regarding update from USCIS; correspondence with C. Rush re: LA field office delays for class members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/21/2020	0.70	507.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with team members, MAVNIs, and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/21/2020	1.20	1,074.00	

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/22/2020	1.80	1,305.00	Internal correspondence regarding status of various class members and next steps re: obtaining naturalization adjudication/delays re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/22/2020	1.50	1,342.50	Address updates and strategy re certain remaining class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/23/2020	0.60	537.00	Discussions with common interest counsel regarding Nio class members' N-400 problems. Review information/inquiry from class member, class member correspondence and follow-up re: same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/25/2020	0.40	290.00	same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/25/2020	0.50	447.50	Address class members' N-400 processing issues.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	5/26/2020	1.80	2,151.00	Address litigation issues for MAVNI class members.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	5/26/2020	1.50	847.50	Update MAVNI website.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/26/2020	0.80	580.00	Internal conference regarding various class members, class member correspondence, and follow-up re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/26/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address Nio class members' issues/updates/concerns, including discussion with common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/27/2020	0.30	217.50	Correspondence with class member and individual counsel for class members regarding updates on naturalization.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/27/2020	0.40	358.00	Updates re Nio class members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	5/28/2020	0.80	956.00	Address litigation strategy for class member; confer w. J. Wollenberg.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/28/2020	1.50	1,087.50	Review/update status regarding various class members; internal correspondence re: same and next steps; conferences with various class member re: naturalization delays / next steps.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	5/29/2020	2.10	1,522.50	Correspondence with class members / follow-up regarding inquiries in Nio inbox from class members, individual counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	5/29/2020	0.80	716.00	Address Nio class members' updates and questions.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	6/1/2020	1.60	1,912.00	Review and address DOJ report and correspondence.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/1/2020	0.90	652.50	Review correspondence from class members and follow-up re: same; correspondence from Judge Harvey's chambers and follow-up re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/1/2020	1.50	1,342.50	Address MAVNI updates and concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and newer team members re assigned class members; review Government's latest reporting and email to Court.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/2/2020	2.30	1,667.50	Review Defendants' filing; report analysis and internal correspondence with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, K. Kaplan re: same; correspondence with court regarding hearing and reporting/next steps; confer with C. Rush, J. Wollenberg re: status of various class members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	6/2/2020	1.00	1,195.00	Address status and strategy.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	6/2/2020	0.90	657.00	Discuss case with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, and N. Raol; prepare response to court on request to continue status conference.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	6/2/2020	0.70	395.50	Update MAVNI website.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/2/2020	2.40	2,148.00	Analyze and discuss Government's June 1 report; updates and questions from C. Rush re Nio class members; address updates/questions/concerns re class members from team members, common interest counsel, and MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	6/3/2020	3.30	3,943.50	Edits and revisions to brief for class member.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	6/3/2020	0.30	219.00	Prepare for and attend mediation conference call.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/3/2020	2.10	1,522.50	Review DOJ reporting; internal correspondence regarding various class members, next steps; review and follow-up re: class member inquiries re: interview/USCIS delays; confer with Judge Harvey re: settlement update (Nio/Kirwa/Calixto).
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/3/2020	0.20	179.00	Mediation discussions.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	6/4/2020	1.40	1,673.00	Address MAVNI class member litigation issues.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/4/2020	3.40	2,465.00	Correspondence with various class members; draft various emails to USCIS re: class member delays and internal follow-up re: same; review DOJ June 1 DOJ reporting re: class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/4/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address updates re and questions from Nio class members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/5/2020	3.10	2,247.50	Draft / send email inquiries to USCIS regarding class members; various internal conferences/correspondence regarding class member status/updates and next steps; confer with J. Wollenberg re: same; analyze DOJ reporting / respond to class member inquiries.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/5/2020	1.00	895.00	Address updates and questions from project teams.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/5/2020	3.80	3,401.00	Address updates and questions from class members and common interest counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	6/8/2020	1.80	2,151.00	Status conference w. Court and prep for same.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	6/8/2020	2.20	1,606.00	Prepare for and attend telephonic status conference; discuss case with D. Baruch and J. Wollenberg.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/8/2020	2.30	1,667.50	Prep for and participate in court hearing (via teleconference); internal correspondence with team, correspondence with class members regarding delays, status, and next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/8/2020	3.80	3,401.00	Prepare for and attend conference and follow-up re same; address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, questions, and updates.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/9/2020	1.50	1,087.50	Internal conference with I. Guo, J. Wollenberg re: class member status/updates and next steps; correspondence with various class members / review draft emails to USCIS re: delays and next steps; follow-up with individual counsel for class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/9/2020	1.50	1,342.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing delays and questions, including update from team working with pre-interview class members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	6/10/2020	0.40	478.00	Address correspondence to USCIS.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/10/2020	0.90	652.50	Review and send draft emails to USCIS re: class member inquiries; internal correspondence re: various class member inquiries, next steps re: naturalization delays and various field office issues.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/10/2020	0.30	268.50	Address updates for MAVNI soldiers; address updates needed to website.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	6/11/2020	1.90	2,270.50	Team call to address litigation strategy and follow up re same.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	6/11/2020	1.50	1,095.00	Discuss case with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, and N. Raol; prepare EAJA fee research assignment.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	6/11/2020	2.20	1,243.00	Discuss MAVNI website with J. Wollenberg; update MAVNI website; discuss MAVNI litigation with summer associate.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/11/2020	1.60	1,160.00	Internal conference with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, K. Kaplan re: case strategy, next steps; internal correspondence and follow-up with class members regarding various updates; review USCIS responses/updates to inquiries.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/11/2020	3.90	3,490.50	Address MAVNI updates and questions; updates to website; planning for next steps.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	6/12/2020	1.60	1,168.00	Review legal research regarding EAJA fee applications; discuss case with D. Baruch and M. Lipsky.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/12/2020	1.70	1,232.50	Review class member correspondence, internal follow-up regarding same and status/updates/delays/strategy for various class members re: naturalization application.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/12/2020	2.20	1,969.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, updates, and concerns.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/14/2020	0.60	435.00	Internal correspondence / draft class member correspondence regarding naturalization application status, potential issues, and next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/14/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including class member naturalization denial notice and MAVNI interview.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/15/2020	1.70	1,232.50	Correspondence with class members with upcoming interviews, re: status of naturalization applications; internal follow-up and review documents re: same; review updates from USCIS and follow-up re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/15/2020	2.80	2,506.00	Address MAVNI questions and requests re N-400 processing.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	6/16/2020	0.30	169.50	Address class member's complaint concerning USCIS and strategy re same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/16/2020	4.50	3,262.50	Confer with J. Wollenberg, C. Rush re: status of various class members, next steps re: pending naturalization application and delays; confer with class member re: upcoming interview/status; review documents from class member and draft correspondence re same.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	6/16/2020	0.90	1,075.50	Review filing and call re strategy for individual MAVNI litigation.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/16/2020	2.30	2,058.50	Address updates, questions, and concerns of class members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/17/2020	0.70	507.50	Internal correspondence and follow-up with class member re: inquiry to USCIS; revise draft re: same; correspondence with individual counsel re: particular MAVNI delays for N400.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/17/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address class members' N-400 delays and issues.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/18/2020	1.70	1,232.50	Internal correspondence re: class member inquiries regarding naturalization status/scheduling of interviews, confusion re: military service; various correspondence with internal team re: next steps/status updates for class members; correspondence with class members.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	6/18/2020	1.30	949.00	Prepare proposed order to close case.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/18/2020	0.50	447.50	Address MAVNI updates, including discussions with team members.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	6/19/2020	1.80	1,314.00	Prepare proposed order for case closure.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/19/2020	1.90	1,700.50	Address class members' questions, updates, and concerns re N-400 processing and next steps, including discussions with common interest counsel and MAVNI soldiers.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/20/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Address MAVNI soldiers questions, updates, and concerns re N-400 processing, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/21/2020	2.30	2,058.50	Address Nio issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/22/2020	2.40	1,740.00	Correspondence/ follow-up with court reporter re: transcript (split with Calixto); confer with J. Wollenberg regarding various class member inquiries and responses / next steps re: same; review USCIS responses to various inquiries and follow-up correspondence.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	6/22/2020	3.40	2,482.00	Revise and comment on EAJA application outline; discuss EAJA application with D. Baruch and M. Lipsky.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/22/2020	3.80	3,401.00	Address MAVNIs' issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/23/2020	6.70	4,857.50	Draft/revise correspondence and class member inquiries to USCIS; internal correspondence with various team members re: same; correspondence with class members review and analysis of Defendants' June 1 report and review files regarding same; correspondence.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	6/23/2020	1.50	1,792.50	Address strategy; correspondence; and class member litigation questions.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/23/2020	5.50	4,922.50	Review status and address needs of class members, including working session with N. Raol, discussions with other team members, and discussions with MAVNIs.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/24/2020	6.40	4,640.00	Review DOJ June 1 reporting; analysis regarding class members and follow-up re: same; internal correspondence with J. Wollenberg; follow-up correspondence with various class members; confer with class member re status.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/24/2020	4.80	4,296.00	Address class members' status and needs, including working session with N. Raol and communications with MAVNIs.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
					Confer with class member, individual counsel, J. Wollenberg re: interview delays, next steps; review DOJ June 1 reporting and confer with J. Wollenberg re: same; analysis regarding class members and follow-up correspondence with class members/individual counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/25/2020	6.10	4,422.50	
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	6/25/2020	0.60	717.00	Address strategy and correspondence w. USCIS.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	6/25/2020	0.20	146.00	Review EAJA fee application research.
					Address class members' issues/updates/concerns, including working sessions with N. Raol and discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/25/2020	6.50	5,817.50	
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	6/26/2020	0.70	836.50	Address correspondence and strategy.
					Draft and send correspondence to USCIS regarding various class members; internal conference with various attorneys/team members; correspondence/conferences with various class members. Address MAVNI updates and needs, including call with team members and discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/26/2020	1.30	942.50	
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/26/2020	5.30	4,743.50	Review class member reporting and follow-up correspondence with class members, review internal files to identify updates and assess next steps re: delays, USCIS issues; confer with J. Wollenberg
					re: same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/27/2020	3.10	2,247.50	
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/27/2020	3.20	2,864.00	Address class members' status and needs, including working session with N. Raol. Analysis regarding defendants' June 1 report; follow-up and correspondence/outreach with class
					members re: next steps.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/28/2020	3.50	2,537.50	
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	6/29/2020	0.40	478.00	Address status and correspondence w. USCIS.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	6/29/2020	0.40	292.00	Review EAJA fee application research.
					Correspondence with various class members, individual counsel; draft/send email inquiries to USCIS; internal follow-up re: same; review USCIS responses to inquiry and class member follow-up
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/29/2020	3.40	2,465.00	re: same.
					Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, updates, and concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and team members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/29/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Review correspondence from USCIS in response to inquiries; follow-up (internal and with class member/individual counsel) re: same and next steps; correspondence with class members
					regarding delays, next steps; confer with J. Wollenberg, C. Rush.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	6/30/2020	1.90	1,377.50	
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	6/30/2020	0.30	169.50	Review response in MAVNI's individual case.
					Address MAVNI questions, updates, and concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs, team
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	6/30/2020	5.20	4,654.00	members, common interest counsel, and USCIS.
					Confer and correspondence with various class members regarding status of pending naturalization
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/1/2020	1.80	1,305.00	applications, delays, and next steps.
					Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/concerns/updates, including discussions with MAVNIs
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/1/2020	3.90	3,490.50	and team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/2/2020	0.90	1,075.50	Review and address strategy and USCIS correspondence.
					Correspondence with various class members; review status, information and draft/send inquiries to
					USCIS; internal correspondence/conference regarding various class members; counsel and court
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/2/2020	2.80	2,030.00	correspondence regarding upcoming status conference.
					Address Nio class members' N-400 issues, including discussions with MAVNIs, team members, and
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/2/2020	5.20	4,654.00	common interest counsel.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/3/2020	2.30	1,667.50	Confer with J. Wollenberg, S. Lo re: class members facing interview delays; confer with J. Wollenberg regarding various class members - status update and correspondence; analysis and update re: class member reporting; review next steps re: class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/3/2020	3.40	3,043.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues and questions, including discussions with MAVNIs and team members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/4/2020	0.40	358.00	Communications with Nio class members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/5/2020	2.90	2,102.50	Confer with class member regarding status/next steps; confer with J. Wollenberg re: various class member issues; analysis re: same; correspondence with class members regarding various updates.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/6/2020	0.60	717.00	Address litigation strategy and USCIS correspondence.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/6/2020	0.70	507.50	Draft emails to USCIS and DOJ regarding inaccuracy on report re: "approved" status; confer and correspondence with class members regarding status/next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/6/2020	4.90	4,385.50	Address N-400 processing issues, including calls with class members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/7/2020	0.60	435.00	Correspondence with class members; confer/correspondence with J. Wollenberg re: various class member inquiries.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/7/2020	4.80	4,296.00	Address N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/8/2020	4.70	3,407.50	Draft various emails to USCIS re: class member inquiries/follow-up and delays; internal correspondence with J. Wollenberg regarding status/updates/next steps for remaining class members and correspondence with class members, individual counsel; review class member updates.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	7/8/2020	0.30	169.50	Review Government's reply brief in class member's case.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/8/2020	0.70	836.50	Address correspondence and strategy.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/8/2020	6.60	5,907.00	Address N-400 processing issues, including working session with N. Raol.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/9/2020	1.30	1,553.50	Address status, strategy, and USCIS correspondence.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/9/2020	3.80	2,755.00	Correspondence with USCIS re: various class members;
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/9/2020	3.90	3,490.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/10/2020	1.20	1,434.00	Address strategy and case closure options; team call re same.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	7/10/2020	1.10	803.00	Discuss cases with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, and N. Raol; prepare proposed case closure order.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/10/2020	3.00	2,175.00	Confer with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, K. Kaplan re: status and preparation for upcoming court conference; correspondence with class member re: upcoming interview; draft summary re: same; prepare/review draft emails for USCIS re: class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/10/2020	4.70	4,206.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, questions, and concerns, including working session with N. Raol and discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/12/2020	1.40	1,015.00	Respond to various class member inquiries and follow-up / review information from M. Carter re: Nio class members who need to be added to upcoming report; ; confer / correspond with J. Wollenberg re: class member updates.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/13/2020	4.10	2,972.50	Draft emails to USCIS re: class member inquiries; internal conference re: same; follow-up correspondence with class members; conference with various class members (re: USCIS delays/improper conduct, next steps, pending applications; review list of new class members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/13/2020	1.20	1,434.00	Address strategy and team call.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/13/2020	7.80	6,981.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues and updates, including discussions with MAVNIs and team members; address next steps for Nio class action.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/14/2020	0.60	717.00	Address DOJ correspondence.
					Confer with J. Wollenberg, C. Rush re: status of various class members; confer with class members regarding next steps, USCIS status/delays; draft/review emails to USCIS re: class member inquiries
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/14/2020	3.10	2,247.50	/ follow-up; correspondence with class members re: same.
					Address MAVNI N-400 processing updates and next steps, including discussions with team
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/14/2020	5.60	5,012.00	members, common interest counsel, and MAVNIs.
					Review correspondence from USCIS and follow-up with class members re: same; draft/send email inquiries to USCIS; internal correspondence/conference re: various class member and next steps
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/15/2020	1.30	942.50	with J. Wollenberg; correspondence with class member individual counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/15/2020	0.80	956.00	Address strategy and correspondence w. USCIS.
					Address N-400 processing issues and concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs, common
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/15/2020	4.20	3,759.00	interest counsel, and team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/16/2020	0.70	836.50	Confer w. client re response to government and follow-up.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	7/16/2020	0.20	146.00	Discuss case with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, and B. Mendelson.
					Conference with class member regarding USCIS naturalization application; internal follow-up re:
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/16/2020	3.20	2,320.00	same; correspondence with potential class member re: N400 status.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/16/2020	3.90	3,490.50	Address N-400 processing issues and questions, including discussions with MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/17/2020	0.50	597.50	Address correspondence w. USCIS and strategy.
					Internal conferences re: various class member status, N400 delays, and next steps;
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/17/2020	2.30	1,667.50	correspondence will class members.
					Address N-400 processing issues, updates, and concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/17/2020	7.90	7,070.50	team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/20/2020	0.80	956.00	Case closure strategy and USCIS correspondence.
					Internal conference with J. Wollenberg, S. McMahon, and I. Guo re: status of various class
					members and next steps/follow-up; internal correspondence re: USCIS inbox responses and next
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/20/2020	4.10	2,972.50	steps; correspondence with individual counsel re: status/USCIS updates.
					Address MAVNI N-400 processing delays/questions/concerns, including discussions with team
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/20/2020	6.90	6,175.50	members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/21/2020	1.80	2,151.00	Class member calls re strategy.
					Address MAVNI N-400 processing questions and concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/21/2020	7.20	6,444.00	team members.
					Address MAVNI updates and questions re N-400 processing, including discussions with MAVNIs
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/22/2020	2.70	2,416.50	and common interest counsel.
					Counsel call re class member litigation strategy; USCIS correspondence; internal call re status and
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/23/2020	1.40	1,673.00	strategy.
					Address class members' questions and issues re N-400 processing, including discussions with
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/23/2020	5.40	4,833.00	USCIS mailbox, MAVNIs, team members, and common interest counsel.
					Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs,
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/24/2020	4.50	4,027.50	common interest counsel, and team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/27/2020	0.70	836.50	Address strategy and preparation for hearing.
					Analysis and review of Defendants' report filed regarding individual class members; confer with J.
					Wollenberg re: same; draft declaration re: client issues with USCIS; review correspondence from
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/27/2020	2.70	1,957.50	USCIS, class members regarding N400 status/updates.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/27/2020	6.70	5,996.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, updates, and concerns; review of Government reporting and discuss with N. Raol.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/28/2020	4.20	3,045.00	Review and confer with J. Wollenberg re: draft filing in response to government's reporting / outstanding class member issues re: USCIS delays; confer with class member re: status /next steps re: N400; follow-up conference/correspondence with J. Wollenberg.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/28/2020	2.20	2,629.00	Address hearing preparation; edits and revisions to filing in response to Defendants' status report.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/28/2020	8.40	7,518.00	Analyze Government's reporting and prepare filing re same; prep for tomorrow's hearing. Internal call re: class member delays with N40 adjudication; prep for status conference (and internal team call re: same); participate in status conference; class member / individual counsel re: USCIS
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/29/2020	4.10	2,972.50	RFE re: N426 and next steps; internal call re: follow-up.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/29/2020	2.70	3,226.50	Preparation for hearing; court hearing; team call re follow-up.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	7/29/2020	3.30	2,409.00	Prepare for and attend Status tele-Conference; discuss case strategy with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, and N. Raol.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/29/2020	4.30	3,848.50	Prepare for, participate in, and follow-up from today's status hearing; address MAVNI questions/updates/concerns, including discussions with team members.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	7/30/2020	0.80	956.00	Call re class member response to government and options.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	7/30/2020	0.70	511.00	Review legal research regarding continuing jurisdiction; case management.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	7/30/2020	3.50	1,977.50	Legal research regarding continuing jurisdiction issues.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/30/2020	2.80	2,030.00	Class member correspondence; internal conference regarding status / next steps re: various class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/30/2020	4.50	4,027.50	Address MAVNI updates and issues with N-400 processing, including discussions with team members. MAVNIs, and common interest counsel.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	7/31/2020	0.30	219.00	Analyze legal research regarding continuing jurisdiction issues.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/31/2020	4.80	3,480.00	Class member correspondence; follow-up internally regarding next steps, USCIS follow-up; review / analyze reporting.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	7/31/2020	0.30	217.50	Review and follow-up with class member re: USCIS response.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	7/31/2020	2.20	1,969.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing delays and questions, including discussions with N. Raol.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	8/3/2020	0.20	146.00	Review continuing jurisdiction legal analysis.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	8/3/2020	3.50	1,977.50	Legal research regarding the EAJA; update MAVNI website.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/3/2020	0.50	362.50	Correspondence with various class members / individual counsel re: status of naturalization application and updates.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/3/2020	1.40	1,253.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing problems.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	8/4/2020	0.70	511.00	Legal research regarding timing of EAJA fee application.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/4/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address class members' N-400 processing problems.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/5/2020	1.20	870.00	Correspondence/confer with various class members re: status of N400 and delays / next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/5/2020	2.20	1,969.00	Address N-400 questions and issues, including discussions with common interest counsel and class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/6/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address issues and updates re N-400 processing for class members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/7/2020	1.70	1,232.50	Confer with J. Wollenberg and common interest counsel re: various class member delays/status and discuss potential next steps; class member correspondence; email correspondence with USCIS re: revocation of N426-related RFE.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/7/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including discussion with common interest counsel; address upcoming joint report.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/9/2020	4.40	3,190.00	Update class-member reporting based on updates from various class members and individual counsel; correspondence with class members and individual counsel re: same; draft/send inquiries to USCIS via Nio inquiry inbox; conference with J. Wollenberg re: all.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/9/2020	4.30	3,848.50	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with N. Raol, common interest counsel, and MAVNIs.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/10/2020	5.90	4,277.50	Correspondence with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, and K. Kaplan re: status of case and various class member issues/inquiries; confer/correspondence with class members regarding status and USCIS N400 delays; draft and send various emails to USCIS Nio inbox.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/10/2020	1.50	1,792.50	Team call re status and strategy, and addressing joint report language.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	8/10/2020	2.00	1,460.00	Discuss case with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, and N. Raol.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/10/2020	5.20	4,654.00	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns; planning for next steps in litigation; contact plaintiffs for updates/paperwork; joint filing draft.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	8/11/2020	1.50	1,095.00	Prepare correspondence with plaintiffs; discuss case with J. Wollenberg.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/11/2020	0.50	597.50	Address correspondence and joint status report.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/11/2020	3.60	2,610.00	Correspondence and conference with various class members and individual counsel; draft and send numerous inquiries to USCIS Nio inbox and follow-up with class members re: responses/updates; confer with J. Wollenberg and C. Rush.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/11/2020	2.90	2,595.50	Address MAVNI updates/issues/concerns; check-in with plaintiffs re updates/paperwork.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/12/2020	2.60	1,885.00	Correspondence re: joint status report filing with court; correspondence/confer with various class members re: status of N400 and various issues including USCIS field office request re: military service; internal follow-up re: same.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/12/2020	0.90	1,075.50	Review correspondence w. USCIS; address joint status report; review DHS motion to dismiss in related case.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/12/2020	1.50	1,792.50	Review draft response to Government for MAVNI.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	8/12/2020	0.20	146.00	Prepare joint report regarding case closure.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/12/2020	5.40	4,833.00	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs; address joint report filing.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/13/2020	0.80	956.00	Addressing strategy and USCIS correspondence.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/13/2020	0.60	435.00	Correspondence from various class members facing N400 delays and USCIS updates; review DOJ report/court filings.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/13/2020	3.30	2,953.50	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with common interest counsel and MAVNIs.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/14/2020	0.90	1,075.50	Conferral w. counsel for class member re litigation options.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/14/2020	0.70	507.50	Class member correspondence/conferences regarding status of N400 delays, updates, and next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/14/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address MAVNI issues, concerns, and updates, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel re same.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/15/2020	2.30	1,667.50	Confer with J. Wollenberg, class member re: N400 updates / next steps; follow-up correspondence with various class members and individual counsel regarding USCIS responses and next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/15/2020	2.30	2,058.50	Address MAVNI updates and questions, including call with MAVNI.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/16/2020	3.10	2,247.50	Correspondence with class members re: next steps; conferences with J. Wollenberg and Nio class members regarding status, next steps, and USCIS N400.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/16/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address MAVNI updates and questions, including calls with MAVNIs and discussions with team member.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/17/2020	5.60	4,060.00	Confer with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, K. Kaplan; participate in court conference re: case closure / next steps; follow-up research re: case dismissal and procedures; review correspondence from Nio USCIS inbox and draft/send inquiries to USCIS Nio inbox.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/17/2020	2.00	2,390.00	Address status hearing and follow-up proposal; confer w. team.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	8/17/2020	6.30	4,599.00	Attend telephonic conference; discuss case with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, and N. Raol; legal research regarding res judicata in class actions and mootness; prepare email correspondence to Court regarding proposed case closure order.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/17/2020	6.50	5,817.50	Strategy and discussion re case closure; address MAVNI N-400 processing issues/questions/concerns; participate in Court's telephone conference; discussions with common interest counsel re similar issues.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/18/2020	1.70	2,031.50	Further edits to proposal re final judgment and confer w. team; correspondence w. USCIS.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	8/18/2020	1.00	730.00	Prepare email correspondence to Court regarding proposed case closure order.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/18/2020	2.40	1,740.00	Draft and send correspondence to Nio USCIS inbox; review draft judgment from chambers; internal correspondence and follow-up re: correspondence with chambers re: dismissal/case closure; correspondences with various class members re: status / N400 delays,
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/18/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with team members and MAVNIs. Confer with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, S. Schuster re: court's proposed draft judgment; review / follow-up correspondence re: correspondence with court; confer with class member re: N400 delays
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/19/2020	3.60	2,610.00	/ potential next steps; review DOJ response re: draft judgment.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/19/2020	0.90	1,075.50	Address proposed judgment and confer w. S. Schuster.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	8/19/2020	0.80	584.00	Prepare revised proposed order and rationale.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/19/2020	2.70	2,416.50	Address case closure options; address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/20/2020	4.50	3,262.50	Research re: Judge Huvelle dismissals re: mootness and internal correspondence re: same; participate in status conference with Court, opposing counsel, and MLB team; post-conference follow-up with MLB team (D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, K. Kaplan); correspondence concerning MAVNI issues.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/20/2020	2.50	2,987.50	Status call w. Court re final judgment; preparation and follow-up re same.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	8/20/2020	2.30	1,679.00	Prepare for and attend conference with Court; discuss case with D. Baruch, J. Wollenberg, and N. Raol.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/20/2020	3.80	3,401.00	Participate in Court's case closure telephone conference and internal discussions re same; address MAVNI issues/updates concerns.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/21/2020	3.10	2,247.50	Draft / send correspondence to USCIS Nio inbox, including follow-up re non-responsiveness; internal correspondence re: next steps; correspondence with class members re: USCIS updates and potential issues; correspondence with individual counsel.
BARUCH, DOUGLAS W.	Partner	8/21/2020	0.70	836.50	Address follow-up inquiries re entry of judgment.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/21/2020	3.20	2,864.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues; address inquiries re Court's final order.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/22/2020	2.50	1,812.50	Confer with class member and J. Wollenberg re: upcoming interview preparation, next steps; follow-up correspondence with various class member re: status.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/22/2020	1.50	1,342.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, including discussions with MAVNIs and team members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/23/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues and questions, including declaration re class member. Correspondence with class members; confer with J. Wollenberg and class member re: status / next steps.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/24/2020	3.30	2,392.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing updates and questions.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/24/2020	1.50	1,342.50	Conferences and correspondence with class members re: next steps and status of litigation / N400 applications.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/25/2020	1.60	1,160.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues and updates.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/25/2020	1.40	1,253.00	Confer with J. Wollenberg, C. Rush re: status of class members; follow-up correspondence with class members and individual counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/26/2020	1.20	870.00	Address MAVNI issues/updates/concerns re N-400 processing.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/26/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Address N-400 processing issues and updates.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	8/27/2020	1.80	1,611.00	Confer with class members regarding status of N400, USCIS questioning re: military service; next steps; confer with J. Wollenberg re: same and next steps; follow-up via email with various class members, individual counsel re: status of N400 and next steps.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/28/2020	4.00	2,900.00	Class member correspondence re: N400 and potential delays.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	8/31/2020	0.80	580.00	Analyze EAJA briefing example.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	9/1/2020	0.40	292.00	Begin overhaul of MAVNI website.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	9/2/2020	4.90	2,768.50	Confer with J. Wollenberg, B. Mendelson re: case update/status and revisions to website, next steps.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/2/2020	2.00	1,450.00	Address website updates.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/2/2020	1.00	895.00	Correspondence with class members regarding status/delays/next steps re: pending N-400.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/3/2020	1.30	942.50	Continue overhaul of MAVNI website.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	9/4/2020	8.20	4,633.00	Address questions/updates/concerns of class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/4/2020	0.50	447.50	Continue MAVNI website overhaul.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	9/5/2020	0.30	169.50	Continue MAVNI website overhaul.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	9/6/2020	4.20	2,373.00	Correspondence with class members facing delays on N-400 regarding status/next steps.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/6/2020	0.30	217.50	Class member correspondence regarding pending N-426 and next steps / delays.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/7/2020	0.50	362.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues and updates.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/8/2020	1.50	1,342.50	Address MAVNIs issues/updates/concerns re N-400 processing.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/9/2020	0.90	805.50	Communicate with IT regarding MAVNI website overhaul.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	9/10/2020	0.30	169.50	Address MAVNIs' issues, updates, and concerns re N-400 processing, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/10/2020	0.90	805.50	Discuss MAVNI website overhaul with IT.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	9/11/2020	0.20	113.00	Work on MAVNI website overhaul.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	9/13/2020	0.60	339.00	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, updates, and concerns.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/14/2020	1.80	1,611.00	Discuss EAJA fee research; address class members' updates and questions.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/15/2020	1.30	1,163.50	Discuss EAJA fee application research with B. Mendelson.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	9/16/2020	0.50	365.00	Coordinate overhaul of MAVNI website; legal research regarding the EAJA.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	9/16/2020	3.00	1,695.00	Correspondence with individual counsel, class members regarding USCIS updates and next steps re: N400.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/16/2020	0.60	435.00	Address class members' updates and questions re N-400 processing.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/16/2020	2.30	2,058.50	

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	9/17/2020	4.90	2,768.50	Legal research regarding the EAJA.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/17/2020	2.30	2,058.50	Address MAVNI N-400 questions and updates, including discussions with common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/18/2020	1.50	1,342.50	Call with common interest counsel re Nio class members' N-400 applications.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	9/18/2020	2.80	1,582.00	Legal research regarding EAJA fees.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/18/2020	0.30	217.50	Correspondence with class members regarding upcoming interview and next steps; follow-up with class member re: status of N400.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/19/2020	0.40	290.00	Correspondence with class member and individual counsel regarding status of N400 and next steps; confer with J. Wollenberg re: same; internal correspondence regarding class members facing N400 delays and next steps/updates.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/20/2020	2.30	1,667.50	Confer with class member, J. Wollenberg, and individual immigration counsel regarding next steps / N400 delays; follow-up correspondence with class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/20/2020	1.00	895.00	Address MAVNI N-400 questions/issues/concerns, including discussion with MAVNI.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/21/2020	1.50	1,087.50	Confer with class member, J. Wollenberg and individual counsel; correspondence with class members regarding N400 status.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/21/2020	1.70	1,521.50	Address MAVNI N-400 processing issues, updates, and concerns, including discussions with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/22/2020	0.80	580.00	Correspondence with class members and individual counsel; internal correspondence / conferences with J. Wollenberg and C. Rush re: same.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/22/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address class member updates and questions re N-400 processing.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/23/2020	0.20	145.00	Confer with J. Wollenberg, C. Rush re: status of class members / updates.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/23/2020	0.50	362.50	Review docket update and initial search re: assigned judge.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/23/2020	0.80	716.00	Address Nio class members' updates.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	9/24/2020	2.00	1,130.00	Legal research regarding EAJA.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/24/2020	1.20	1,074.00	Address MAVNI updates and questions regarding USCIS processing and problems with their N-400 applications.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	9/25/2020	0.70	395.50	Continue EAJA research.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/25/2020	0.40	290.00	Correspondence with class members re: status of N400 and next steps.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/25/2020	0.80	716.00	Address MAVNI updates and questions.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	9/26/2020	2.00	1,130.00	Draft memo regarding EAJA.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/28/2020	1.30	1,163.50	Address Nio class member N-400 processing issues and updates.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	9/29/2020	0.50	447.50	Address class member updates.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	9/30/2020	0.80	580.00	Correspondence with several class members re: N400 status and next steps.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/2/2020	1.70	1,232.50	Review status of class members and confer with J. Wollenberg re: same; follow-up correspondence with class members, individual counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/2/2020	2.50	2,237.50	Address updates, questions, and concerns regarding remaining Nio class members, including discussion with N. Raol and emails with MAVNIs and common interest counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/4/2020	0.50	447.50	Address Nio class member updates and questions.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/5/2020	4.50	4,027.50	Address notification to USCIS of additional evidence re military service for MAVNI naturalization applicant.
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	10/6/2020	0.40	226.00	Review updates to clientsite.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/6/2020	0.50	362.50	Confer with J. Wollenberg, C. Rush re: class members with pending N400s; email correspondence with class member and individual counsel re: interview delays and concerns re: same.

Timekeeper	Title	Worked Date	Hours	Amount	Narrative
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/6/2020	3.50	3,132.50	Address updates and questions re Nio class members' N-400 processing.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/7/2020	0.60	537.00	Address updates and questions re Nio class members' N-400 processing.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/14/2020	0.80	716.00	Discussions with common interest counsel re D. Renaud declarations.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/15/2020	0.80	716.00	Address updates and questions from Nio class members.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	10/16/2020	0.50	365.00	Legal research regarding protective cross-appeal filing.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/16/2020	1.40	1,015.00	Correspondence and conferences with various class members re: N400 delays.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	10/19/2020	1.00	730.00	Prepare Notice of Cross-Appeal.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/19/2020	0.50	362.50	Follow-up and correspondence regarding DOJ's notice of appeal and cross-appeal.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/19/2020	0.80	716.00	Address updates and questions from Nio class members.
					Conferences and correspondence with class members regarding status of N400; review/update
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/20/2020	1.80	1,305.00	government's last Nio report with information/updates from class members and individual counsel.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/20/2020	0.60	537.00	Address updates re Nio class members.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/22/2020	1.20	870.00	Correspondence / follow-up re: Nio DC Circuit appeal; correspondence with class members/counsel
MENDELSON, BENJAMIN WALLACE	Associate	10/23/2020	2.40	1,356.00	Legal research regarding certain appellate procedure issues; calendar appeal deadlines.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/23/2020	0.60	537.00	Address questions and updates re Nio class members.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/25/2020	0.20	179.00	Address question from Nio class member.
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/26/2020	0.30	217.50	Correspondence with class member's individual counsel re: upcoming interview. internal follow-up
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/26/2020	0.50	447.50	Address class member updates and questions.
					Correspondence and follow-up with various class members; internal follow-up and draft email re:
RAOL, NEAHA P.	Associate	10/28/2020	1.70	1,232.50	class member facing N400 hold based on military checks.
WOLLENBERG, JENNIFER M.	Partner	10/28/2020	0.70	626.50	Address updates and questions regarding Nio class members.
KAPLAN, KAYLA S.	Associate	10/29/2020	0.20	146.00	Prepare Notice of Cross-Appeal.
			2,564.10	\$2,183,377.00	

Total \$ 2,286.61

Date	Cost Description	Amount
10/2/2019	Court Transcripts	\$ 421.95
10/24/2019	WestLaw	\$ 143.00
11/4/2019	WestLaw	\$ 71.50
11/6/2019	WestLaw	\$ 250.25
12/3/2019	Court Transcripts	\$ 291.00
12/9/2019	Other Legal Research TLO Report	\$ 10.00
12/9/2019	Other Legal Research TLO Report	\$ 20.00
1/27/2020	Court Transcripts	\$ 118.82
2/27/2020	Other Legal Research TLO Report	\$ 20.00
2/27/2020	Other Legal Research TLO Report	\$ 10.00
3/9/2020	Court Transcripts	\$ 121.25
6/8/2020	Court Transcripts	\$ 142.38
7/29/2020	Court Transcripts	\$ 45.34
2019, 2020	Website Hosting/Software Fees	\$ 621.12